OFFICE OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW

REGISTER 2008, NO. 10-Z PUBLISHED WEEKLY BY THE OFFICE OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW MARCH 7, 2008

PROPOSED ACTION ON REGULATIONS

TITLE 2. FAIRPOLITICAL PRACTICES COMMISSION
Conflict of Interest Codes—Notice File NO. Z08-0225-02 . ... ...t 319
STATE AGENCY: Secretary of State

TITLE 2. FAIRPOLITICAL PRACTICES COMMISSION

Complaints—Notice File NO. Z08—-0225-01 .. ... .. it e e e e e e 320
TITLE 4. STATE ATHLETIC COMMISSION

Various Regulatory Proposals and Amendments — Notice File No. 08022202 ............. ... ..cvivn... 321
TITLE 4. CALIFORNIA HORSE RACING BOARD

Occupational Licenses and Fees—Notice File No. Z08-0226-05 ....... ... ...t 324
TITLE 10. MANAGED RISK MEDICAL INSURANCE BOARD

HFP — AB203 Deletion of Medi—Cal Bridge — Notice File No. Z08-0226-10 ............. . .c.covuuiinnnnn. 328
TITLE 10. MANAGED RISK MEDICAL INSURANCE BOARD

HFP — Disenrollment/Waiting List — Notice File No. Z08-0226-09 ........ ... ..ttt 331
TITLE 14. DEPARTMENT OF PARKS AND RECREATION

Land and Water Conservation Fund Program—Notice File No. Z08-0225-03 ............ ... ..., 333
TITLE 17. DEPARTMENT OF DEVELOPMENTAL SERVICES

Respite Care Rate Increase — Notice File NO. Z08—-0226-03 ... .. i e e e 336
TITLE 24. BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION

Amend the 2007 California Plumbing Code, Part 5—Notice File No. 08-0226-01 ........................ 338

GENERAL PUBLIC INTEREST

DEPARTMENT OF FAIR EMPLOYMENT AND HOUSING
List of Prospective Contractors Ineligibleto Enter Into SateContracts  ............. ... 341

(Continued on next page)

Time-
Dated
Material



RULEMAKING PETITION DECISIONS

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS AND REHABILITATION
Regarding Petitioner Tuvalu Tutuila Concerning a Satewide Toilet Flushing Policy ........................ 341

ACCEPTANCE OF PETITION TO REVIEW ALLEGED UNDERGROUND
REGULATIONS

Regarding Department of Corrections and Rehabilitation Concerning In-evel Inmate Transfers
to other Prisons* Unless There is a Medical/Mental Health Necessity (of the inmate) or Transfers
Required to Maintain the Safety and Security of the Institution.” ........ ... ... . . . i it 343

OAL REGULATORY DETERMINATIONS
(2008 OAL Determination No. 1) — Indeterminate Security Housing Unit Status for Disruptive

0 LT 346
SUMMARY OF REGULATORY ACTIONS

Regulations filed with the Secretary Of State . ... ... i e e e 350
Sections Filed, September 26, 2008 to February 27, 2008 .. .. ... . it e 353

The California Regulatory Notice Register is an official state publication of the Office of Administrative Law containing
notices of proposed regulatory actions by state regulatory agencies to adopt, amend or repeal regulations contained in the
California Code of Regulations. The effective period of a notice of proposed regulatory action by a state agency in the
California Regulatory Notice Register shall not exceed one year [ Government Code § 11346.4(b)]. It is suggested, therefore,
that issues of the California Regulatory Notice Register be retained for a minimum of 18 months.

CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER (USPS002-931), (ISSN 1041-2654) is published weekly by the Office
of Administrative Law, 300 Capitol Mall, Suite 1250, Sacramento, CA 95814-4339. The Register is printed by Thomson West
and is offered by subscription for $302.00 (annual price). To order or make changes to current subscriptions, please call (800)
888-3600. “Periodicals Postage Paid in Saint Paul, MN.” POSTMASTER: Send address changes to the: CALIFORNIA
REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER, Thomson—West/Barclays, P.O. Box 2006, San Francisco, CA 94126. The Register can
also be accessed at http://www.oal.ca.gov.



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

PROPOSED ACTION ON
REGULATIONS

Information contained in this document is
published as received from agencies and is
not edited by Thomson West.

TITLE 2. FAIR POLITICAL
PRACTICES COMMISSION

NOTICE ISHEREBY GIVEN that the Fair Political
Practices Commission, pursuant to the authority vested
init by sections 82011, 87303, and 87304 of the Gov-
ernment Code to review proposed conflict of interest
codes, will review the amended conflict of interest
codesof thefollowing agencies:

CONFLICT OF INTEREST CODE

AMENDMENT

STATE AGENCIES: Secretary of State

A written comment period has been established com-
mencing on March 7, 2008, and closing on April 21,
2008. Written comments should be directed to
Adrianne Korchmaros, Fair Political Practices Com-
mission, 428 J Street, Suite 620, Sacramento, Califor-
nia95814.

At the end of the 45—-day comment period, the pro-
posed amendment to the conflict of interest codewill be
submitted to the Commission’s Executive Director for
review, unless any interested person, or his or her duly
authorized representative, requests, no later than 15
days prior to the close of the written comment period, a
public hearing before the full Commission. If a public
hearing is requested, the proposed amendment will be
submitted tothe Commissionfor review.

The Executive Director of the Commission will re-
view the above—referenced amendment to the conflict
of interest code, proposed pursuant to Government
Code section 87300, which designates, pursuant to
Government Code section 87302, employeeswho must
disclose certain investments, interestsin real property,
andincome.

The Executive Director or the Commission, upon his
or her own motion or at the interest of any interested
person, will approve, or revise and approve, or return

319

the amendment to the agency for revision and re-sub-
mi ssionwithin 60 dayswithout further notice.

Any interested person may present statements, argu-
ments, or comments, inwriting to the Executive Direc-
tor of the Commission, relative to review of the pro-
posed amendment to the conflict of interest code. Any
written comments must be received no later than April
21, 2008. If a public hearing is to be held, oral com-
ments may be presented to the Commission at the hear-

ing.

COST TO LOCAL AGENCIES

There shall be no reimbursement for any new or in-
creased costs to local government which may result
from compliance with these codes because these are not
new programs mandated on local agencies by the codes
sincetherequirements described herein were mandated
by the Political Reform Act of 1974. Therefore, they are
not “ costs mandated by the state” asdefined in Govern-
ment Codesection 17514.

EFFECT ON HOUSING COSTS
AND BUSINESSES

Compliance with the codes has no potential effect on
housing costs or on private persons, businesses, or
small businesses.

AUTHORITY

Government Code sections 82011, 87303, and 87304
providethat the Fair Political Practices Commission as
the code reviewing body for the above conflict of inter-
est code shall approve codes as submitted, revise the
proposed code, and approve it asrevised, or return the
proposed codefor revision and re-submission.

REFERENCE

Government Code sections 87300 and 87306 provide
that agencies shall adopt and promulgate conflict of in-
terest codes pursuant to the Political Reform Act and
amend their codes when change is necessitated by
changed circumstances.

CONTACT

Any inquiries concerning the proposed conflict of in-
terest code(s) should be madeto Adrianne Korchmaros,
Fair Political Practices Commission, 428 J Street, Suite
620, Sacramento, California 95814, telephone (916)
322-5660.



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

TITLE 2. FAIR POLITICAL
PRACTICES COMMISSION

NOTICE ISHEREBY GIVEN that the Fair Political
Practices Commission (hereafter, “the Commission”),
under the authority vested in it by Section 83112 of the
Government Code, proposesto adopt, amend, or repeal
regulationsin Title 2, Division 6 of the California Code
of Regulations. The Commission will consider the pro-
posed regulation at a public hearing on or after April
10, 2008, at the offices of the Fair Political Practices
Commission, 428 J Street, Suite 800, Sacramento,
California, commencing at approximately 10:00 a.m.
Written comments must bereceived at the Commission
officesnolater than5:00 p.m.onApril 9, 2008.

BACKGROUND/OVERVIEW

Government Code Section 83115 permits the Com-
mission to pursue investigations of violations of the
Political Reform Act (Government Code Sections
81000-91014; hereafter, “the Act”) onitsowninitiative
or in responseto asworn complaint filed with the Com-
mission. If the Commission receives a sworn com-
plaint, the complainant isentitled to receive written no-
tification from the Commission within aspecified time
period ontheactionitintendstotakeonthecomplaint.

The Commission adopted 2 Cal. Code Regs. Section
18360 to implement and interpret Government Code
Section 83115 in 1975 and the | ast substantive amend-
ment to the regulation was made in 1982. The regula-
tion has never been modified to implement amend-
ments to Government Code Section 83115 made in
1985. Also, court rulingsin recent years concerning is-
suesof procedural due processmakeit necessary for the
Commission to reconsider some of the procedures con-
tained in the regulation. In addition, the provisions of
the regulation must be modified to facilitate the Com-
mission’s compliance with the California Public Re-
cords Act (Government Code Section 6250 et seq.). Fi-
nally, itisnecessary to make several clarifying, stylistic
and other nonsubstantive amendments to the regula-
tion.

The Commission also proposes amending 2 Cal.
CodeRegs. Section 18361 to correct anincorrect cross—
reference and permit the Commission’s Executive Di-
rector to delegate his or her duties under 2 Cal. Code
Regs. Section 18360in specified circumstances.

REGULATORY ACTION

Amend 2 Cal. CodeRegs. Section 18360

The substantive amendments to the regulation to be
considered by the Commission, and the reasons for the
amendments, are set forth bel ow.

320

Subdivision (a) of theexisting regulation only applies
the formal complaint process to complaints aleging
violations of the Act at the state level. Government
Code Section 83115 does not confine its application to
alleged state-level violations. Therefore, the Commis-
sion proposes modifying theregul ationto apply thefor-
mal complaint processto any aleged violations of the
Act, whether at thestateor local level. The Commission
also proposes adding language to clarify that the Com-
mission may investigate complaints on its own initia-
tive.

Subdivision (b) of the existing regulation permits a
formal complaint to be filed by use of either the Com-
mission’s own form or adocument created by the com-
plainant that includes specified minimum information.
The Commission has developed a forma complaint
form, available online, to ensure consistency in format
and save staff time in processing these complaints.
Also, sincetheformal complaint issigned under penal-
ty of perjury, the Commission proposes adding aprovi-
sion requiring that a forma complainant state in the
complaint the basis for his or her personal knowledge
that theallegationsaretrueand correct.

Subdivision (c) of theexisting regul ation permits per-
sons to file “informal” complaints with the Commis-
sion. Government Code Section 83115 makes no men-
tion of informal complaints and the regulation does not
specify their format. The Commission proposes modi-
fying theregulation to permit aperson who doesnot de-
sire to file a forma complaint to supply information
concerning possible violations to the Commission by
telephone and, at the complainant’s option, do so anon-
ymously. Thiswill savestaff timeinnot only processing
unnecessary paper but also in obtaining more focused
information on the alleged violation. As clarified in
subdivision (a), the Commission retains the ability to
“investigate possible violations,” pursuant to Section
83115, “onitsown initiative” and can use this focused
informationto do so.

Also, the existing regul ation requires staff to provide
the Commissionerswith unspecified information onin-
formal complaints on aregular basis (subdivision (c))
and provide Commissionerswith acopy of each formal
complaint (subdivision(d)).

To avoid potential due process issues, the Commis-
sioners should be provided with the minimal informa-
tion necessary to inform them of the mattersunder con-
sideration by the Commission’s Enforcement Division.
Therefore, the Commission proposesamending thereg-
ulation to define exactly what information will be pro-
vided to the Commissioners on both formal complaints
and matters the Commission is pursuing onitsown ini-
tiative. The amendments aso clarify that a Commis-
sioner may request acopy of any formal complaint, un-
lessit is determined that providing the complaint will



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

compromise hisor her impartiality in that matter. (See
proposed subdivision (d).)

Subdivisions(e) through (i) of the existing regulation
reguire the Commission and staff to engage in apoten-
tially elaborate processto arrive at adecision on the ac-
tionto takeon theformal complaint and notify the com-
plainant of that decision. The process could involve as
many asthree Commission closed sessionsand internal
deliberations of indeterminate length. Most of these
procedures are unduly complicated, unnecessarily con-
sume time of the Commission and staff, pose serious
due process concerns, and delay providing theinforma-
tionto thecomplainant required by Section 83115.

The Commission therefore proposes eliminating this
process and amending the regul ation to instead provide
that the Executive Director’sresponseto the complain-
ant asset forth in new subdivision (f) serve asthe Com-
mission’s statutorily—required response to the formal
complaint. When the Commission informs the com-
plainant it will investigate the complaint, the letter will
caution the complainant that the culpability of the per-
son who isthe subject of the complaint has not been de-
termined. When the Commission informs the com-
plainantitwill takeno action onthecomplaint, theletter
will indicate that the complainant can submit additional
information. Also in subdivision (f), the Commission
proposes providing personswho arethe subject of afor-
mal complaint with information on the complaint, sub-
ject to the Commission’s discretion to withhold all or
part of theinformation and the nondisclosureisconsis-
tent with the requirements of law, which would include
theCaliforniaPublic RecordsAct.

In new subdivision (g), the Commission proposes
providing a person who files a formal complaint with
continuing information onthe statusof the caseafter the
Commission’s Enforcement Division commences an
investigation of thecomplaint.

Amend 2 Cal. CodeRegs. Section 18361

This regulation currently permits the Commission’s
Executive Director to delegate his or her authority un-
der the Commission’s enforcement regulations when
the Executive Director is unavailable or cannot be fair
or impartial inaparticul ar enforcement matter. Thereg-
ulation must be amended to correct an incorrect cross—
reference to a Commission regulation that does not ex-
ist. In addition, the Commission proposes amending
this regulation to permit the Executive Director to be
ableto also delegate hisor her dutiesunder 2 Cal. Code
Regs. Section 18360.

SCOPE

The Commission may adopt or reject all or part of the
languagenoticed herein, or it may choose new language

321

to implement its decisions concerning theissuesidenti-
fied aboveor relatedissues.

FISCAL IMPACT STATEMENT

Fiscal Impact on Local Government. This regulation
will have no fiscal impact on any local entity or pro-
gram.

Fiscal Impact on State Government. This regulation
will have no fiscal impact on any state entity or pro-
gram.

Fiscal Impact on Federal Funding of State Programs.
Thisregulationwill have nofiscal impact onthefederal
funding of any stateprogram or entity.

AUTHORITY

Government Code Section 83112 provides that the
Fair Political Practices Commission may adopt, amend,
and rescind rules and regulations to carry out the pur-
posesand provisionsof thePolitical ReformAct.

REFERENCE

Thepurposeof 2 Cal. Code Regs. Section 18360isto
implement, interpret, and make specific Government
Code Section 83115. The purpose of 2 Cal. Code Regs.
Section 18361 istoimplement, interpret, and make spe-
cific Government Code Sections 83115, 83115.5 and
83116.

CONTACT

Any inquiries should bemadeto Scott Hallabrin, Fair
Political PracticesCommission, 428 JStreet, Suite 800,
Sacramento, CA 95814; telephone (916) 322-5660 or
1-866—-A SK—FPPC. Proposed regulatory language can
be accessed at http://www.fppc.cagov/index.html?id=
351.

TITLE 4. STATE ATHLETIC
COMMISSION

NOTICEISHEREBY GIVEN that the State Athletic
Commission (hereinafter “Commission”) is proposing
to take the action described in the Informative Digest.
Any person interested may present statements or argu-
ments orally or in writing relevant to the action pro-
posed at a hearing to be held at the Junipero Serra State
Building located at 320 West Fourth Street, Carmel
Room, Los Angeles, California90013, at 9:00 a.m., on
April 22, 2008. Written comments, including those sent
by mail, facsimile, or e-mail to the addresseslisted un-
der Contact Person in this Notice, must be received by




CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

the Commission at its office not later than 5:00 p.m. on
April 22, 2008 or must be received by the Commission
at the hearing. The Commission, upon its own maotion
or at theinstance of any interested party, may thereafter
adopt the proposals substantially as described below or
may modify such proposals if such modifications are
sufficiently related to the original text. With the excep-
tion of technical or grammatical changes, thefull text of
any modified proposal will be available for 15 days
prior to its adoption from the person designated in this
Noticeascontact person and will bemailedto those per-
sonswho submit written or oral testimony relatedtothis
proposal or who have requested notification of any
changestotheproposal.

Authority and Reference: Pursuant to the authority
vested by Sections 18611and 18763 of the Businessand
Professions Code, and to implement, interpret or make
specific Sections 18640, 18642, 18710, 18714, 18724,
18725, 18765, 18842, and 18843 of said Code, the
Commission is considering changes to Division 2 of
Title4 of theCaliforniaCode of Regulationsasfollows:

INFORMATIVE DIGEST/POLICY STATEMENT
OVERVIEW

1. Adopt Rule227.

Existing regulation does not include any procedures
for arbitration of acontract dispute between licenseesof
the Commission. This proposed regulation will estab-
lish proceduresfor mediating contractsby arepresenta-
tiveof theCaliforniaState Athletic Commission.

2. AmendRule281.

Existing law gives the Commission sole direction,
management, control of, and jurisdiction over all pro-
fessional and amateur boxing, professional and amateur
kickboxing, all forms and combinations of full contact
martial arts contests, including mixed martia arts, and
matchesor exhibitions conducted, held, or givenwithin
thisstate.

Existing law authorizes the Commission to license
professional and amateur boxers and professional and
amateur martial artsfighters.

Existing regulation does not describe the specific in-
dicatorsthat the Commission usesto eval uatethe physi-
cal condition of a boxer in order to determine the box-
er’s eligibility for a license. This proposa would in-
clude adescription of the specific physical factorsused
by the Commission to eval uate the condition of the box-
er as the Commission must ensure that applicants are
qualifiedto engagein combativesports.

This proposal would also renumber existing subsec-
tionstoreflect theaddition of thenew language.

322

3. Amend Rule303.

Existing Section 303 prohibits the administration or
use of any drugs, alcohol or stimulants, or injectionsin
any part of thebody, either beforeor during amatch.

Thisproposa would provide specific health and safe-
ty requirements regarding drug testing and the conse-
guences surrounding a positive drug test result by set-
ting out the procedures for testing and the substances
beingtested.

4. Adopt Rule 314.

Existing law contains certain specifications for the
ring in which professional or amateur boxing contests
areheld.

It also authorizes the Commission to establish glove
weights, equi pment standards, safety standards, and the
length of roundsin order to protect the health and saf ety
of contestants.

Thisproposa would permit the Commissionto allow
professional boxing matchesto beheldinaroped enclo-
sure that meets the specifications of Section 523 if
Commissionapproval isgranted.

5. AmendRule323.

Existing Rule 323 specifies hand bandage require-
ments.

This proposal would conform the rule to the hand
bandage requirementsestablished by the Association of
Boxing Commissionsin its Regulatory Guidelines and
Rulesmodified July 27, 2005, whichreflectsthe nation-
al standard.

6. Amend Rule 368.

Existing regulation does not permit the Commission
to change fina decisions in athletic contests after the
victor hastested positivefor aprohibited substance.

This proposed amendment would permit the Com-
mission to change a decision where the victor tested
positivefor aprohibited substance and would renumber
the remaining subsections accordingly. It would also
establishthat achange of decision shall bereferredto as
“nodecision.”

7.Adopt Rule 389.

Existing law authorizes the Commission, the Execu-
tive Officer and other employeesduly authorized by the
Executive Officer to temporarily suspend any license
until final determination by the Commission, when in
his or her opinion, the action is necessary to protect the
publicwelfareor isinthe best interest of boxing or mar-
tial arts. The suspension may be without advance hear-
ing, but the suspended licensee may apply to the Com-
mission for a hearing on the matter to determine if the
suspension should bemodified or set aside.

Existing law authorizes the Commission, the Execu-
tive Officer and other employeesduly authorized by the
Executive Officer to assess fines not to exceed two



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

thousand five hundred dollars ($2,500) for each viola-
tion of any provisions of the chapter or any of therules
and regulationsof the Commission. Thefinemay beas-
sessed without advance hearing, but the licensee may
apply to the Commission for a hearing on the matter to
determineif thefineshould bemodified or set aside.
This proposal would establish procedures for those
hearings.
8. AmendRule523.

Existing Section 523(a) references Sections 310
through 312 regarding ring requirements for kickbox-
ing contests. This proposal would permit an alternate
ring for kickboxing events.

FISCAL IMPACT ESTIMATES

Fiscal Impact on Public Agencies|ncluding Costs or
Savings to State Agencies or Costs/Savingsin Federal
Fundingtothe State:

The proposal for Section 227 will not have any fiscal
impact. It ssimply formalizes aprocedurein the Califor-
niaCodeof Regulations.

The amendment of Section 281 will not have any fis-
cal impact. It ssimply formalizes health and safety li-
censing guidelines in the California Code of Regula-
tions.

Theamendment of Section 303 will not haveasignif-
icant financial impact on businesses. However, the
Commission may be required to submit arevised con-
tract proposal to the Department of General Servicesto
revise current drug testing methods and to acquire new
drug testing supplies. The current cost utilizing current
methods for drug testing is $99,500 over a period of
twenty months. It isnot anticipated therewill beafinan-
cial increase in the cost of servicesbut it may require a
contractual change to establish services with another
drugtesting provider.

The proposal for Section 314 will not have a signifi-
cant financial impact on businesses. However, the
Commission may experience an increasein the number
of events as more licensed promoters attempt to hold
“mixed” events showcasing multiple sports. It should
be noted the Commi ssion may experience adecreasein
the number of events as more licensed promoters hold
“mixed” events because it will decrease their business
expensesper event. Ineither case, the Commission may
experience an increase or decrease of approximately
$5,000 per event from revenue generated from the
event. Additionally, licensed officials in the State of
California may experience an increase or decrease in
the amount of wages earned per event. This could posi-
tively or negatively impact approximately 75 officials
statewide. While the potential effects of this proposal

323

are neither greatly positive nor adverse, they are poten-
tial effectsnonethel ess.

No fiscal impact is expected from amendments to
Section 323 to conform to the hand bandage require-
ments established by the Association of Boxing Com-
missionsin their Regulatory Guidelines and Rules mo-
dified July 27, 2005.

The amendment of Section 368 is not expected to
have any fiscal impact as it strictly pertains to the
changeof decisioninanathletic contest.

The appeal procedure set out in Section 389 will not
have any fiscal impact. The proposal merely formalizes
the procedure for appeal inthe California Code of Reg-
ulations.

The proposed change for Section 523 will not have a
significant financial impact on businesses. The Com-
mission may experience an increase in the number of
events as licensed promoters attempt to hold “mega
events’ showcasing multiple sports. However, the
Commission could experience adecreasein the number
of eventsaspromotershold“ multiple-sport” eventsbe-
causeit will decreasetheir business expenses per event.
In either case, the Commission may experience an in-
crease or decrease of approximately $5,000 per event
from revenue generated from the event. Additionaly,
licensed officialsin the State of Californiamay experi-
ence an increase or decrease in the amount of wages
earned per event. This could positively or negatively
impact approximately 75 officials statewide. Whilethe
potential effectsof thisproposal areneither greatly pos-
itivenor adverse, they arepotential effectsnonethel ess.

Nondiscretionary Costs/Savings to Local Agencies.
None

Local Mandate: None

Cost to Any Local Agency or School District for
Which Government Code Section 17561 Requires Re-
imbursement: None

Businesslmpact:

After areview of the proposed additions and changes
to the existing rules, the Commission has made an ini-
tial determination that the proposed regulatory action
would not have any significant statewide adverse eco-
nomic impact directly affecting business, including the
ability of California businesses to compete with busi-
nessesin other states.

and

Thefollowing studies/relevant datawererelied upon
inmaking theabovedetermination: None

Impact on Jobs/New Businesses.

The Commission has determined that these regulato-
ry proposals would not have any significant impact on
the creation of jobsor new businessesor theelimination
of jobs or existing businesses or the expansion of busi-




CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

nessesin the State of California, although it isexpected
toresultinasignificantincreaseineventsin California

Cost Impact on Representative Private Person or
Business.

TheCommissionisnot awareof any cost impactsthat
arepresentative private person or business would nec-
essarily incur in reasonable compliance with the pro-
posed regulatory actions. Theproposalsgivethelicens-
eesguidelinesfor arbitration, formalize healthand safe-
ty guidelines, specify the details of the Commission’s
drug testing program, alow professional boxing to be
heldin afiveroped ring, set standards for the wrapping
of an athlete’shands, change the outcome of an athletic
contest after an athletetests positive for prohibited sub-
stances, set the guidelinesin place for an appeal by ali-
censee, and allow kickboxing and mixed martial artsto
be contested in the same competition enclosure during
thesameevent.

Effect on Housing Costs: None

EFFECT ON SMALL BUSINESS

The Commission has determined that some of the
proposed regulations would have a minimal impact on
small businessesthat are operating as promoters of box-
ing, kickboxing, and mixed martial artsin the State of
Cdifornia. The businesses will benefit if multiple
sports may competein one competition enclosure. This
could potentially increase or decrease the number of
eventsinthe Stateof California

CONSIDERATION OF ALTERNATIVES

The Commission must determine that no alternative
it considered or that has otherwise been identified and
brought to its attention would be more effective in car-
rying out the purposefor which the actionsare proposed
or would be as effective and less burdensome to af-
fected private persons than the proposals described in
thisNotice.

Any interested person may present statements or ar-
gumentsorally or inwriting relevant to the above deter-
minationsat theabove-mentioned hearing.

INITIAL STATEMENT OF REASONS
AND INFORMATION

The Commission has prepared aninitial statement of
the reasons for the proposed actions and has available
al of the information upon which the proposals are
based.

TEXT OF PROPOSAL

Copies of the exact language of the proposed regula-
tions and of theinitia statement of reasons, and all of

324

the information upon which the proposal is based, may
be obtained at the hearing or prior to the hearing upon
request from the California State Athletic Commission
at 1424 Howe Avenue, Suite 33, Sacramento, Califor-
nia95825.

AVAILABILITY AND LOCATION OF
THE FINAL STATEMENT OF REASONS
AND RULEMAKING FILE

All theinformation upon which the proposed regula-
tionsarebased iscontainedintherulemaking filewhich
isavailablefor public inspection by contacting the per-
son named below. You may obtain a copy of the final
statement of reasonsonceit hasbeen prepared, by mak-
ing awritten request to the contact person named bel ow
or by accessing thewebsitelisted below.

CONTACT PERSON

Inquiriesor comments concerning the proposed rule-
making action may beaddressedto:

Name: Bill Douglas

Address: 1424 HoweAvenue, Suite 33
Sacramento, CA 95825

TelephoneNo.:  (916) 263-2195

Fax No.: (916) 263-2197

E-Mail Address:  william_douglas@dca.ca.gov
Thebackup contact personis:

Name: Armando Garcia

Address: 1424 HoweAvenue, Suite33
Sacramento, CA 95825

TelephoneNo.:  (916) 263-2195

Fax No.: (916) 263-2197

E-Mail Address. armando_garcia@dca.ca.gov
Website Access. Materias regarding this proposal
canbefound at www.dca.ca.gov/csac.

TITLE 4. CALIFORNIA HORSE
RACING BOARD

CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS
NOTICE OF PROPOSAL TO AMEND
RULE 1481. OCCUPATIONAL LICENSES AND
FEES
RULE 1783. REGISTRATION OF STABLE
NAMES
RULE 1784. REGISTRATION TO DISCLOSE ALL
PARTNERS

The California Horse Racing Board (Board) pro-
poses to amend the regulation described below after
considering all comments, objections or recommenda-
tionsregarding the proposed action.



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

PROPOSED REGULATORY ACTION

The Board proposes to amend Rule 1481, Occupa-
tional Licensesand Fees, to add theterm “ Stable Name
Group” to subsection 1481(e) and (f). The Board aso
proposes to amend Rule 1783, Registration of Stable
Names and Rule 1784, Registration to Disclose All
Partners, to provide for the registration of stable name
groups.

PUBLIC HEARING

The Board will hold apublic hearing starting at 9:30
a.m., Thursday, April 24, 2008, or as soon after that as
business before the Board will permit, at Hollywood
Park Racetrack, 1050 South Prairie Avenue, Ingle-
wood, Califor nia. At the hearing, any person may pres-
ent statements or arguments orally or in writing about
the proposed action described in theinformative digest.
It is requested, but not required, that persons making
oral comments at the hearing submit a written copy of
their testimony.

WRITTEN COMMENT PERIOD

Any interested persons, or their authorized represen-
tatives, may submit written comments about the pro-
posed regulatory action to the Board. The written com-
ment period closesat 5:00 p.m.,on April 21,2008. The
Board must receiveall commentsat that time; however,
written comments may still be submitted at the public
hearing. Submit commentsto:

Harold Coburn, Regulation Analyst
CdliforniaHorseRacing Board
1010Hurley Way, Suite 300
Sacramento, CA 95825
Telephone(916) 263-6397

Fax: (916) 263-6022

E-Mail: harolda@chrb.ca.gov

AUTHORITY AND REFERENCE

Authority cited: Rule 1481: sections 19440, 19510,
19520 and 19704, Business and Professions Code. Ref-
erence: sections 19510, 19520 and 19704, Businessand
ProfessionsCode.

Business and Professions Code sections 19440,
19510, 19520 and 19704 authorize the Board to adopt
the proposed regulation, which would implement, in-
terpret or make specific sections 19510, 19520 and
19704, Businessand ProfessionsCode.

325

Authority cited: Rule 1783 sections 19440 and
19460, Businessand Professions Code. Reference: sec-
tions 19460 and 19520 Businessand Professions Code.

Business and Professions Code sections 19440 and
19460 authorize the Board to adopt the proposed regu-
lation, which would implement, interpret or make spe-
cific sections 19460 and 19520, Business and Profes-
sionsCode.

Authority cited: Rule 1784. sections 19440 and
19460, Business and Professions Code. Reference:
19460 and 19520, Businessand Professions Code.

Business and Professions Code sections 19440 and
19460 authorize the Board to adopt the proposed regu-
lation, which would implement, interpret or make spe-
cific sections 19460 and 19520, Business and Profes-
sionsCode.

INFORMATIVE DIGEST/POLICY STATEMENT
OVERVIEW

Business and Professions Code section 19440 pro-
videsthat the Board shall haveall powersnecessary and
proper to enableit to carry out fully and effectually the
purposes of this chapter. Responsibilities of the Board
shall includelicensing of eachracing associationand all
persons, other than the public at large, who participate
in a horse race meeting with pari—-mutuel wagering.
Businessand Professions Code section 19510 statesev-
ery steward and racing official not required to be li-
censed under Article 4 (commencing with section
19480) shall be licensed by the Board pursuant to Ar-
ticle 5 (commencing with section 19510). Businessand
Professions Code section 19520 statesevery person not
required to be licensed under Article 4 (commencing
with section 19480) who participatesin, or hasanything
to do with the racing of horses, shall be licensed by the
Board pursuant to rules and regulations that the Board
may adopt. Business and Professions Code section
19704 provides that the Board shall issue alicense for
participantsin muleracing. Thelicense shall belimited
to muleracesonly. Business and Professions Code sec-
tion 19460 states all licenses granted under this chapter
shall be in writing; are subject to al rules, regulations,
and conditions prescribed by the Board; and shall con-
tain such conditions as are deemed necessary or desir-
ableby theBoardfor the purposesof thischapter.

The Board proposes to amend Rule 1481. The rule
liststhe various classes of occupational licensesissued
by the Board, and types of entities that must register
with the Board. The proposed amendment to Rule 1481
adds stable name groups to subsections 1481(e) and
1481(f). Subsection 1481(e) requires that a person or
persons electing to conduct racing operations by use of
astable namegroup shall register the stable name group
and pay afeeof $300. The stable namegroupisastable



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

name under which one or more entities may run. Each
entity running under a stable name group would own
one or more horses independent of other entities that
may run under the same stable name group. Subsection
1481(f) provides that an entity running under a stable
name group shall register with the Board as an entity
running under a stable name group and pay a fee of
$300. Registering the entity that runs under a stable
name group ensuresthe Board knowswho is participat-
ing in the entity, and which partnersin that entity must
be licensed as horse owners. It a so tellsthe Board how
many entitiesarerunning under astablenamegroup.

The proposed amendment to Rule 1783 adds a new
subsection 1783(b), which provides that a stable name
group may be registered with the Board, and is subject
to subparagraph 1783(a)(1) through (a)(5). These sub-
paragraphs provide the conditions under which astable
name may beregistered. Thiswill ensurethe Board has
oversight, and eliminates confusion for the racing of-
ficeandthe Board'slicensing staff dueto thelargenum-
bers of persons who may be involved in stable name
groups. Subsection 1783(b) also states the stable name
group may establish multiple entities that shall run un-
der the name of the registered stable name group. The
entitiesthat run under astable name group arewhat dif-
ferentiate a stable name group from a stable name. A
stable name is an assumed name under which a person
or persons (partners) races horses. A stable name group
is an assumed name that will buy a horse and form a
partnership or limited liability company (entity) that
sells ownership shares in the horse. When the horse is
ready to run, it will run under the name of the stable
name group. The stable name group may establish one
or moresuchentities.

Subparagraph 1783(b)(1) states each entity that runs
under a stable name group shall register in accordance
with Rule 1481, 1506, 1507 and 1784 of this division.
Rule 1481 providesthat the entity shall register withthe
Board and pay afee of $300. Rule 1506, Horse Owner-
ship by Corporation or Limited Liability Company,
states if ahorse owner isalimited liability company it
shall appoint one or more managing employee(s), who
if qualified, may be granted a license as horse owner,
and who shall assume all responsibilities of an owner.
Somelarge stables currently buy horsesthat they sell to
investors as limited liability companies. In these
instancesthe“employee” isthe stable name owner who
manages the horse for the LLC. Rule 1507, Partner-
ships, states that all general partners assume equal re-
sponsibilities as owner and no limited partner shall be
licensed asahorse owner. Somelarge stablesform part-
nershipsaround individual horses. Thegeneral partners
in such entities must be licensed. Rule 1784, Registra-
tion to Disclose All Partners, provides that a stable
name registration shall disclose the real names of all

326

ownershipinterests, and the percentage of ownership of
each. The Board desires stable name groups to comply
with the disclosure requirement to ensureit isinformed
regarding the true ownership of a horse, and that al
ownersarelicensed, if required. If the ownership inter-
est is an entity, such as a partnership, corporation or
LLC, it must comply with the Board's registration re-
quirements.

Subsection 1783(b)(2) states the entity formed under
astablegroup nameshall namethehorse(s) it owns, and
it statesthe horse(s) shall be owned separately from oth-
er entitieswithin the stable name group. Thiswill serve
to keep the entities separate within the stable name
group. Thisis an issue because of the large numbers of
persons who may form an entity. Mixing ownership of
horses amongst different entities under a stable name
group could lead to alot of confusion for the racing of -
fice and Board occupational licensing staff, as they
must keep track of horse ownership and the licensing
status of such owners. This does not preclude a person
from participatinginoneor moreentities.

Subsection 1783(b)(3) requireseach entity to possess
aunique roster of owners that names each owner, the
percentage of ownership of each and if an owner is a
general or limited partner. Theroster shall befiled with
the Board and theracing office. The uniqueroster helps
to keep the entities separate for licensing staff and the
racing office. Information regarding the percentage of
ownership of each owner andif an owner isageneral or
limited partner will help Board licensing staff to deter-
mine if a person participating in an entity must be li-
censed asahorseowner. TheBoard usestheterms* gen-
eral” and “limited” partner for partnershipsand LLCs.
This helps Board staff determine who should be li-
censed. Therosters must be filed with the racing office
and Board staff, as the racing office maintains the
horse's papers, and the Board’s occupational licensing
staff isresponsible for licensing and checking the daily
program to ensurethat thetrainersand ownersof horses
enteredtoraceareproperly licensed.

Subsection 1783(b)(4) providesthat alicensed owner
may participate in the horse ownership of one or more
entitiesthat run under astable namegroup. Thiswill al-
low any owner to invest in multipleentitiesrunning un-
der stable namegroups. The Board wishesto encourage
horse ownership, but many persons who desire to par-
ticipate in horse racing as an owner cannot afford to
ownahorseinitsentirety. Stablenamegroupsprovidea
vehiclethat allows personsinterested in horseracing to
enjoy the benefits of horse ownership without the full
burden of itscosts. Additionally, itisnot uncommonfor
horse owners to form partnerships with other horse
owners. The Board has no restrictions on the number of
partnershipsinwhich an owner may participate.



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

Subsection 1783(b)(4)(A) provides that a partner
whose ownership interest in an entity running under a
stablenameis 10 percent or lessof such entity may elect
not to obtain alicenseahorseowner. Thiswill alow the
stable name group to market horse ownership to per-
sonswho may not wish to be licensed. However, it also
putsalimit onthepercentage of ownershipinterest for a
person who does not wish to belicensed. Thiswill pre-
vent an unlicensed person from owning asignificant in-
terest in an entity. If a partner who owns 10 percent or
less of an entity that runs under a stable name group
chooses nat to be licensed, they shall be considered a
limited partner for the purposes of Rule 1783. Board
Rule 1507 statesno limited partner may be granted ali-
cense as horse owner. If such partner decided they wish
to belicensed asahorse owner, they shall be considered
ageneral partner under Rule 1783. The Board requires
that all general partnersshall belicensed.

Subsection 1783(c) providesthat apartner who owns
10 percent or less of an entity that runs under a stable
name group is not subject to the provisions of Rule
1606, Coupling of Horses, when a horse owned by the
entity inwhich thepartner participatesisenteredtorace
in the same race in which the partner has ownership in-
terest in another horsethat isentered to race. The Board
determined that ownership of 10 percent or less of a
horse would not provide the opportunity or incentive
for an owner to influence how the horse performsin a
race. Uncoupling the horseswhere an owner hassuch a
small interest in one of the horses also promotes larger
fieldswith morewagering interests. Uncoupling horses
is not without precedent, as under Rule 1606, Quarter
horseracesarecurrently exempt from coupling.

Subsection 1783(b)(5) has been modified to add
“stablenamegroup.” A stablenamegroupisafictitious
name, and is subject to the laws of the State of Califor-
nia regarding the use of fictitious names for business
purposes.

The proposal to amend Rule 1784 adds a new sub-
paragraph 1784(b), which provides that a registered
stable name group shall comply with subparagraph
1784(a) for each entity that runs under the stable name
group. Thiswould require the stable namegroup to dis-
closethereal nameand ownershipinterest of al persons
or entitiesparticipatingin each entity that runsunder the
stable name group. The Board has an interest in know-
ing who owns a horse, as it is charged under Business
and Professions Code section 19401 with assuring the
protection of thepublic.

DISCLOSURE REGARDING THE
PROPOSED ACTION

Mandateonlocal agenciesand school districts: none.

327

Cost or savingsto any stateagency: none.

Cost to any local agency or school district that must
be reimbursed in accordance with Government Code
Section 17500 through 17630: none.

Other non—discretionary costs or savings imposed
uponlocal agencies. none.

Cost or savingsinfedera fundingtothestate: none.

The Board has made an initial determination that the
proposed amendment of Rule 1481, Rule 1783 and Rule
1784 will not have asignificant, statewide adverse eco-
nomic impact directly affecting businessincluding the
ability of California businesses to compete with busi-
nessesin other states.

Cost impact on representative private persons or
businesses: The Board isnot aware of any cost impacts
that a representative private person or business would
necessarily incur in reasonable compliance with the
proposed action.

Significant effect on housing costs: none.

The adoption of the proposed amendment of Rule
1481, Rule 1783 and Rule 1784 will not (1) create or
eliminate jobs within California; (2) create new busi-
nesses or eliminate existing businesses within Califor-
nia; or (3) affect the expansion of businesses currently
doing businesswithin California.

Effect on small businesses: none. The proposa to
amend Rule 1481, Rule 1783 and Rule 1784 doesnot af -
fect small businessesbecause horseracingisnot asmall
businessunder Government Code Section 11342.610.

CONSIDERATION OF ALTERNATIVES

In accordance with Government Code Section
11346.5, subdivision (a)(13), the Board must determine
that no reasonable alternative considered, or that has
otherwisebeenidentified and brought to the attention of
the Board, would be more effective in carrying out the
purposefor whichtheactionisproposed, or would beas
effective and less burdensome on affected private per-
sonsthan the proposed action.

The Board invitesinterested personsto present state-
ments or arguments with respect to alternatives to the
proposed regul ation at the scheduled hearing or during
thewritten comment period.

CONTACT PERSON

Inquiries concerning the substance of the proposed
action and requests for copies of the proposed texts of
theregulations, theinitial statement of reasons, the mo-
dified textsof theregulations, if any, and other informa-
tion upon which the rulemaking is based should be di-
rectedto:



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

Harold Coburn, Regulation Analyst tice, the proposed texts of theregulationsand theinitial
CdliforniaHorseRacing Board statement of reasons. The Board's web site addressiis:
1010 Hurley Way, Suite 300 www.chrb.ca.gov.

Sacramento, CA 95825

Telephone: (916) 263-6397 TITLE 10. MANAGED RISK MEDICAL
E mail: harolda@chrb.ca.gov INSURANCE BOARD

If the person named aboveisnot available, interested

partiesmay contact: NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULEMAKING
R-1-07

AndreaOgden, Regulation Analyst

Telephone: (916) 263-6033
TITLE 10. CALIFORNIA CODE OF

REGULATIONS
AMEND SECTION 2699.6611
REGARDING
HEALTHY FAMILIES PROGRAM
DELETION OF HFP TO MEDI-CAL BRIDGE

AVAILABILITY OF INITIAL STATEMENT
OF REASONS AND TEXT OF
PROPOSED REGULATION

The Board will have the entire rulemaking file avail-
able for inspection and copying throughout the rule-

making processat itsofficesat the above address. Asof NATURE OF PROCEEDING
the date this notice is published in the Notice Register,
the rulemaking file consists of this notice, the proposed NOTICE 1S HEREBY GIVEN tha the Managed

text of the regulations, and the initial statement of rea- RISk Medical Insurance Board (MRMIB) is proposing
sons. Copiesmay be obtained by contacting Harold Co- totaketheactiondescribedinthelnformative Digest.

burn, or the alternative contact person at the address, A public hearing regarding this proposal will be held

phonenumber or e-mail addresslisted above. on April 21, 2008, at 10:00 a.m. at 1000 G Street, Suite
450, Sacramento, CA 95814.

AVAILABILITY OF MODIFIED TEXT Following the public hearing MRMIB may thereafter

adopt the proposal substantially as described below or
After holding a hearing and considering all timely may modify the proposalsif the modificationsare suffi-
and relevant comments received, the Board may adopt ciently related tothe original text. With the exception of
the proposed regulations substantially as described in technical or grammatical changes, the full text of any
this notice. If modifications are made which are suffi- modified proposal will beavailablefor 15 daysprior to
ciently related to the originally proposed texts, the mo- itsadoption from the person designated inthisNoticeas
difiedtexts, with changesclearly marked, shall bemade contact person and will be mailed to those personswho
available to the public for at least 15 days prior to the submit written comments related to this proposal, or
date on which the Board adopts the regulations. Re- who provide oral testimony if a public hearing is held,
questsfor copies of any modified regul ations should be or who haverequested notification of any changestothe
sent to the attention of Harold Coburn at the address proposal.

stated above. The Board will accept written comments Noticeisalso given that any interested person, or his

onthemodified regulationsfor 15 daysafter thedateon or her authorized representative, may submit written

whichthey aremadeavailable. comments relevant to the proposed regulation action to
the

AVAILABILITY OF STATEMENT OF REASONS M anaged Risk Medical Insurance Board

Requestsfor copiesof thefinal statement of reasons, Attn: JoAnneFrench

which will be made available after the Board has 1000G Street, Suite450

adopted the proposed regul ationsin their current or mo- Sacramento, CA 95814

dified form, should be sent to the attention of Harold Comments may also be submitted by facsimile
Coburn at theaddressstated above. (FAX) a (916) 327-6580 or by e-mail to
jfrench@mrmib.ca.gov. Comments must be submitted
prior to5:00 p.m.on April 21, 2008.

AUTHORITY AND REFERENCE

BOARD WEB ACCESS

The Board will have the entire rulemaking file avail-
able for inspection throughout the rulemaking process Authority: Insurance Code section 12693.21 and
at its web site. The rulemaking file consists of the no- 12693.755, Insurance Code and References: 12693.21,

328



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

12693.45, 12693.74, 12693.77, 12693.755, 12693.98,
and 12693.981 of the Government Code, the Managed
Risk Medical Insurance Board is considering changes
to Title 10, Chapter 5.8, of the CaliforniaCode of Regu-
lationsasfollows: Amend section 2699.6611.

INFORMATIVE DIGEST/POLICY STATEMENT
OVERVIEW

The MRMIB operatesthe Healthy Families Program
(HFP), which was established in 1997 pursuant to
Chapter 623, Statutes of 1997 (AB1126) to provide
health insurance for low—income children. The pro-
gram is targeted to serve children whose family’s in-
come, athough low, istoo high to qualify for the Title
XIX Medicaid Program, called Medi—Cal in California.

AB 430 (Chapter 171, Statutesof 2001) originally es-
tablished the Healthy Families-to-Medi—Cal Bridge
benefits (Bridge). The Bridge was approved in 2002 by
the Centersfor Medicareand Medicaid Services(CMS)
as acomponent of the parental waiver under Title X XI
of the Socia Security Act (the Medicaid statute). The
waiver expired on January 24, 2007. CM Sofferedtoex-
tend the parental waiver through June 30, 2007, but
conditioned the extension on aretroactive change of the
federal/state cost from 65/35 to 50/50 to 2002 when the
Bridge was first implemented. Under Title X1X of the
Social Security Act, the state has the authority to pro-
vide presumptive €ligibility (PE) to children who ap-
pear to be eligible for full-scope Medi—Cal benefits.
Under PE, full-scope Medi—Cal fee—for—service bene-
fitsareprovidedto children pendingan eligibility deter-
mination. The federal financial participation under the
programis50/50.

AB 203 (Chapter 188, Statues of 2007) isthe state’s
responseto CMS' condition. Instead of agreeing to the
condition, the bill directs MRMIB to eliminate the
Healthy Families-to-Medi—Cal bridge benefits when
the director of the Department of Health Care Services
(DHCYS) declares that PE for no—cost Medi—Cal has
beenimplemented. On November 30, 2007, thedirector
of DHCS released the directive that the HFP to Medi—
Cal PresumptiveEligibility program wasimplemented,
commencing September 1, 2007. Implementing AB
203 requires changes to the current HFP regulations to
reflect that subscriber childrenwill bedisenrolled at the
end of the anniversary month in which they are deter-
mined no longer eligible for HFP and Healthy Fami-
lies-to—M edi—Cal bridgebenefitswill not be provided.

Thereareno comparableprovisionsof federal law re-
lated tothisproposal.

329

LOCAL MANDATE

This proposal does not impose a mandate on local
agenciesor school districts.

FISCAL IMPACT ESTIMATES

This proposa does not impose a mandate on local
agencies or school districts for which reimbursement
would berequired pursuant to Part 7 (commencing with
Section 17500 of Division 4 of the Government Code).
This proposal does not impose other nondiscretionary
cost or savings on local agencies. This proposal does
not result in any cost or savingsinfederal funding tothe
State.

COSTS OR SAVINGS TO STATE AGENCIES

Fiscal Effect on State Government:

AB 203 amended section 12693.981 of theInsurance
Codeto discontinuethe Healthy Families Program-to—
Medi—Cal bridge benefit and, instead, place children
who are no longer eligible for HFPR, and appear eligible
for Medi—Cal, in a presumptive eligibility coverage
programinlieuof bridge benefits.

Cdlifornia has a presumptive eligibility program in-
frastructure currently in placefor Medi—Cal which pro-
videsimmediate benefitsto uninsured children who ap-
pear eligiblefor Medi—Cal whilethefull eligibility de-
termination isbeing processed. Thispresumptiveeligi-
bility is approved by the federal government at
50%—-50% fund sharing.

Sincethe Medi—Cal program already hasauthority to
grant presumptive eligibility and current processes are
aready in place to transfer case information to the 58
counties for final determination, the administrative
costs for this option would be minimal since adminis-
trativeprocesseswereal ready established.

The cost for the bridge program would have been
$4.8million ($2.4 million GF @ thereduced 50% M ed-
icaid federal participation rate) based on updated 2007
May Revision caseload projections for the 2007 State
Budget. The cost included inthe 2007 Budget to imple-
ment this proposal is $4.4 million ($2.2 million GF @
the 50% Medicaid federa participation rate); a
$200,000 savingsinannual GF cost.

Sincethe previous base budget for the Bridge waiver
would have been $4.8 million with a GF cost of $1.7
million (reflecting the previous 65% federal participa-
tion rate), the net increase to the base budget is
$500,000 in GF costs ($2.2 million in the 2007 Budget,
lesstheexisting $1.7 million basebudget).




CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

This presumptive eligibility cost is already included
inthe2007 StateBudget.

Fiscal Effect On Federal Funding Of State
Programs:

Under the Title X X1 State Children’s Health Insur-
ance Program (S-CHIP), the Federal government cov-
ers 65% of al eligible program costs for the Healthy
Families Program. The regulations will result in re-
duced federal fund expendituresof $900,000.

BUSINESS IMPACT/SMALL BUSINESS

MRMIB has made an initial determination that the
proposed regulatory action would have no significant
statewide adverse economic impact directly affecting
business, including the ability of Californiabusinesses
to competewith businessesin other states. The proposal
does not affect small businesses as defined by section
11342.610. The determination that the proposal would
not affect small businessis based upon the fact that the
proposal applies only to the procedures followed by
MRMIB should adetermination of insufficient funding
bemadeby theBoard. It hasnoimpact at all onany enti-
ty that is not a state agency as defined in section 11000
of the California Government Code as the regulations
only establish procedures.

ASSESSMENT REGARDING EFFECT
ON JOBS/BUSINESSES

The MRMIB has determined that thisregulatory pro-
posal will not have any impact on the creation of jobsor
new businesses or the elimination of jobs or existing
businessesor the expansion of businessesin the State of
Cdifornia.

COST IMPACTS ON REPRESENTATIVE
PERSON OR BUSINESS

The MRMIB is hot aware of any cost impacts that a
representative private person or business would neces-
sarily incur inreasonabl e compliancewith the proposed
action.

EFFECT ON HOUSING COSTS
None
ALTERNATIVES
The MRMIB must determine that no reasonable al-

ternative considered by the agency, or that has been
otherwiseidentified and brought to the agency’s atten-

330

tion, would be more effective in carrying out the pur-
pose for which the adoption of this regulation is pro-
posed, or would be as effective as and less burdensome
toaffected private personsthan the proposed action.

CONTACT PERSONS

Inquiries concerning the proposed adoption of this
regul ation and written commentsmay bedirectedto:

JoAnneFrench

Managed Risk Medical InsuranceBoard
1000 G Street, Suite450

Sacramento, CA 95814

(916) 3277978

or

Randi Turner

Managed Risk Medical InsuranceBoard
1000 G Street, Suite450

Sacramento, CA 95814

(916) 327-8243

INITIAL STATEMENT OF REASONS

The MRMIB hasprepared aninitial statement of rea-
sonsfor the proposed action and hasavailableal thein-
formationuponwhichthe proposal isbased.

TEXT OF PROPOSAL

Copies of the exact language of the proposed regula-
tions and of theinitia statement of reasons, and all of
theinformation upon which this proposal isbased, may
be obtained upon request from the Managed Risk M edi-
cal Insurance Board at 1000 G Street, Suite 450, Sacra-
mento, CA 95814. These documents may also be
viewed and downloaded from the MRMIB website at
www.mrmib.ca.gov.

AVAILABILITY AND LOCATION OF
THE FINAL STATEMENT OF REASONS
AND RULEMAKING FILE

All theinformation upon which the proposed regula-
tionsarebasediscontainedintherulemaking filewhich
isavailablefor public inspection by contacting the per-
sonnamed above.

You may obtain a copy of the final statement of rea-
sonsonceit has been prepared, by making awritten re-
guest tothecontact person named above.

WEBSITE ACCESS

Materials regarding this proposal can be found at
WwWw.mrmib.ca.gov.




CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

TITLE 10. MANAGED RISK MEDICAL
INSURANCE BOARD

NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULEMAKING
R—2-07

TITLE 10. CALIFORNIA CODE OF
REGULATIONS
ADOPT SECTIONS, 2699.6603 and 2699.6604
AND AMEND SECTIONS 2699.6603
(renumbered to 2699.6602), 2699.6605, 2699.6607,
2699.6608, 2699.6611, and 2699.6625.
REGARDING ESTABLISHING A WAITING
LIST AND DISENROLLMENT PROCEDURES
INTHE HEALTHY FAMILIESPROGRAM

NATURE OF PROCEEDING

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the Managed
Risk Medical Insurance Board (MRMIB) is proposing
totaketheactiondescribedinthelnformativeDigest.

A public hearing regarding this proposal will be held
on April 21, 2008, at 1:30 p.m. at 1000 G Street, Suite
450, Sacramento, CA 95814.

Followingthe public hearing MRMIB may thereafter
adopt the proposal substantially as described below or
may modify the proposal sif the modifications are suffi-
ciently related totheoriginal text. With the exception of
technical or grammatical changes, the full text of any
modified proposal will be availablefor 15 daysprior to
itsadoption from the person designated in thisNoticeas
contact person and will be mailed to those personswho
submit written comments related to this proposal, or
who provide oral testimony if apublic hearing is held,
or who havereguested notification of any changestothe
proposal.

Noticeisalso given that any interested person, or his
or her authorized representative, may submit written
comments relevant to the proposed regulator action to
the

Managed Risk Medical InsuranceBoard
Attn: JoAnneFrench

1000 G Street, Suite450

Sacramento, CA 95814

Comments may also be submitted by facsimile
(FAX) at (916) 327-6580 or by email to
jfrench@mrmib.ca.gov. Comments must be submitted
prior to5:00 p.m. onApril 21, 2008.

331

AUTHORITY AND REFERENCE

Pursuant to the authority vested by Section 12693.21
and 12693.755, Insurance Code, and Reference Sec-
tions 12693.21, 12693.45, 12693.70, 12693.71,
12693.73, 12693.74, 12693.77, 12693.755, 12693.765,
12693.96, 12693.98, and 12693.981, Insurance Codes,
the Managed Risk Medical Insurance Board is consid-
ering changesto Title 10, Chapter 5.8, of the California
Code of Regulations as follows. Adoption of sections
2699.6603 and 2699.6604 and amendment of sections
2699.6603 (renumbered to 2699.6602), 2699.6605,
2699.6607, 2699.6608, 2699.6611 and 2699.6625.

INFORMATIVE DIGEST/POLICY STATEMENT
OVERVIEW

The MRMIB operatesthe Healthy Families Program
(HFP), which was established in 1997 pursuant to
Chapter 623, Statutes of 1997 (AB1126) to provide
health insurance for low—income children. The pro-
gram is targeted to serve children whose family’s in-
come, although low, istoo high to qualify for the Title
X1X Medicaid Program, called Medi—Cal in California.
HFP currently provides health insurance for more than
845,635 low—income children. Approximately two—
thirdsof the programisfunded through thefederal State
Children's Health Insurance Program (SCHIP) (42
U.S.C. 1397aa et seq.) The federal reimbursement is
known as*federal financial participation.”

Theauthorization for SCHIPwas scheduled to expire
on September 30, 2007. In late September 2007, Con-
gresspassed, and the President signed, acontinuing res-
olution to continue SCHIP and provide the states with
thesame, or “flat,” level of funding asthe previousfed-
eral fiscal year (FFY).1 (House Joint Resolution 52.)
Two further continuing resolutions were passed by
Congress and signed by the President providing flat
funding (House Joint Resolution 3222, signed by the
President on November 13, 2007 and House Resolution
69 signed by the President on December 14, 2007). Fi-
nally, on December 29, 2007, Congress passed and the
President signed legidation authorization to continue
SCHIP until March 29, 2009 (Senate Bill 2499). The
legislation included sufficient funding to maintain
projected enrollment level s through March 2009. With
a new Administration and Congress in place after the
2008 election, the prospectsfor federal funding beyond
March 2009 are unknown.

Theenabling HFP statute requiresthe Board to main-
tain enrollment and expenditures to ensure that expen-
ditures do not exceed amounts available and, if suffi-
cient fundsare not availableto cover the estimated cost
of program expenditures, the program must instituteap-

1 The federal fiscal year is from October 1 to September 30.



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

propriate measures to limit enrollment. The proposed
regulations would provide regulatory authority for the
Board to establish waiting lists and disenroll children
subscribers at their Annual Eligibility Reviews. The
present regul ationsdo not providefor specific measures
tolimit enrollment.

In Fall 2007, because of the uncertainty of federal
funding as described above, the Board found an emer-
gency under Government Code sections 11342.545 and
submitted the proposed regul ationsto OAL onanemer-
gency basisto enablethe Board to meet its statutory ob-
ligations: (1) to ensure that expenditures do not exceed
amounts available and (2) if sufficient funds are not
availableto cover the estimated cost of program expen-
ditures, toinstitute appropriate measuresto limit enrol |-
ment.2 (Ins. Code sec. 12693.21(n).) These proposed
regulations were approved by the OAL on November
30, 2007, as emergency regulations. While the short—
term uncertainly of federal funding has lessened, the
proposed regulations are still needed for the Board to
meet is statutory obligations should funds become in-
sufficient to cover the estimated cost of program expen-
dituresinthefuture.

Thereareno comparableprovisionsof federal law re-
latedtothisproposal.

LOCAL MANDATE

This proposal does not impose a mandate on local
agenciesor school districts.

FISCAL IMPACT ESTIMATES

This proposal does not impose a mandate on local
agencies or school districts for which reimbursement
would berequired pursuant to Part 7 (commencing with
Section 17500 of Division 4 of the Government Code).
This proposal does not impose other nondiscretionary
cost or savings on local agencies. This proposal does
not result in any cost or savingsinfedera funding tothe
state.

COSTS OR SAVINGS TO STATE AGENCIES

No additional costs or savings to state agencies are
anticipated.

2 The adoption of the proposed regulations would not beitself es-
tablish a waiting list or disenroll subscriber children. Further
Board actionswould be required as set forth in the proposed regu-
lations. The adoption would only provide for the processto limit
enrollment as circumstances dictate.

332

BUSINESS IMPACT/SMALL BUSINESS

MRMIB has made an initial determination that the
proposed regulatory action would have no significant
statewide adverse economic impact directly affecting
business, including the ability of California businesses
to competewith businessesin other states. The proposal
does not affect small businesses as defined by section
11342.610. The determination that the proposal would
not affect small businessis based upon the fact that the
proposal applies only to the procedures followed by
MRMIB should adetermination of insufficient funding
bemadeby theBoard. It hasnoimpact at all onany enti-
ty that is not a state agency as defined in section 11000
of the California Government Code as the regulations
only establish procedures.

ASSESSMENT REGARDING EFFECT
ON JOBS/BUSINESSES

The MRMIB has determined that thisregulatory pro-
posal will not have any impact on the creation of jobsor
new businesses or the elimination of jobs or existing
businessesor the expansion of businessesin the State of
Cdifornia.

COST IMPACTS ON REPRESENTATIVE
PERSON OR BUSINESS

The MRMIB is not aware of any cost impacts that a
representative private person or business would neces-
sarily incur inreasonabl e compliancewith the proposed
action.

EFFECT ON HOUSING COSTS

None

ALTERNATIVES

The MRMIB must determine that no reasonable al-
ternative considered by the agency, or that has been
otherwise identified and brought to the agency’s atten-
tion, would be more effective in carrying out the pur-
pose for which the adoption of this regulation is pro-
posed, or would be as effective as and less burdensome
to affected private personsthan the proposed action.

CONTACT PERSONS

Inquires concerning the proposed adoption of this
regul ation and written commentsmay bedirectedto:

JoAnneFrench

Managed Risk Medical InsuranceBoard
1000 G Street, Suite450

Sacramento, CA 95814

(916) 3277978



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

or

Randi Turner

Managed Risk Medical InsuranceBoard
1000 G Street, Suite450

Sacramento, CA 95814

(916) 327-8243

INITIAL STATEMENT OF REASONS

TheMRMIB hasprepared aninitial statement of rea-
sonsfor the proposed action and hasavailableall thein-
formation uponwhichtheproposal isbased.

TEXT OF PROPOSAL

Copies of the exact language of the proposed regul a-
tions and of theinitial statement of reasons, and all of
theinformation upon which thisproposal isbased, may
be abtained upon request from the M anaged Risk Medi-
cal Insurance Board at 1000 G Street, Suite 450,Sacra-
mento, CA 95814. These documents may also be
viewed and downloaded from the MRMIB website at
www.mrmib.ca.gov.

AVAILABILITY AND LOCATION OF
THE FINAL STATEMENT OF REASONS
AND RULEMAKING FILE

All the information upon which the proposed regula-
tionsarebasediscontainedintherulemakingfilewhich
isavailablefor public inspection by contacting the per-
sonnamed above.

You may obtain a copy of thefina statement of rea-
sons once it has been prepared by making awritten re-
guest tothe contact person named above.

WEBSITE ACCESS

Materials regarding this proposal can be found at
www.mrmib.ca.gov.

TITLE 14. DEPARTMENT OF PARKS
AND RECREATION

TITLE 14. NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION 3. CALIFORNIA DEPARTMENT OF
PARKSAND RECREATION
CHAPTER 12. LAND AND WATER
CONSERVATION
[Notice published March 7, 2008]

333

NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULEMAKING

The California Department of Parks and Recreation
(Department) proposes to adopt the proposed regula-
tions described below after considering all comments,
objections, and recommendations regarding the pro-
posed action.

PUBLIC HEARING

The Department has scheduled a public hearing on
this proposed action starting at 9:00 am. on April 29,
2008, at Rusch Park Community Center, Room 1 lo-
cated at 7801 Auburn Blvd. Citrus Heights, California
95610. The Community Center is wheelchair accessi-
ble. At the hearing, any person may present statements
or arguments orally or in writing relevant to the pro-
posed action described in the Informative Digest. The
Department requests but does not require that persons
who make oral comments at the hearing also submit a
written copy of their testimony at thehearing.

WRITTEN COMMENT PERIOD

Any interested person, or hisor her authorized repre-
sentative, may submit written commentsrelevant to the
proposed regulatory action to the Department. The
written comment period closes at 5:00 p.m. on April
29, 2008. The Department will consider only comments
received at the Department offices by that time. Submit
commentsto:

Ms. DebraGonzalez

Officeof Grantsand L ocal Services
CaliforniaDepartment of Parksand Recreation
P.O. Box 942896

Sacramento, CA 94296-0001

Email: dgonzalez@parks.ca.gov

Fax: (916) 653-6511

Phone: (916) 6541618

AUTHORITY AND REFERENCE

Public Resources Code (PRC) 85099.10 authorize
the Department to adopt the proposed regul ation, which
would implement, interpret, or make specific PRC
§85099-5099.12 and 16 USC 4601-4601-11 (Public
Law 88-57878 Stat 897).

INFORMATIVE DIGEST/POLICY STATEMENT
OVERVIEW

The LWCF was established through the Land and
Water Conservation Fund Act of 1965 (Act). The Act
providesfederal fundsto assist Statesand Federal agen-



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

cies in meeting present and future outdoor recreation
demands and needs of the citizens of the United States
for planning, acquisition, and development of needed
land and water areasand facilitiesand fundsfor the Fed-
eral acquisition and development of certain lands and
other areas. The funds are allocated to the states each
federal fiscal year by apportionment established by the
Act and authorized by the Secretary of thelnterior.

Public Resources Code (PRC) §85098-5098.3 estab-
lished a State fund in which thefundsreceived fromthe
federa government could be deposited. Public Re-
sources Code (PRC) §85099-5099.12 was enacted to
enable California to participate in the LWCF (Public
Law 88-578 78 Stat 897). It also defined eligible appli-
cants, and how thefundswereto bedivided between | o-
cal government and stateagencies.

Regulations for the Land and Water Conservation
Fund were developed to comply with PRC 85099.10.
Over time the Department has developed Procedural
Guidesto update and provide more guidance for the ad-
ministration of the program. The procedura guide has
not been submitted to the Office of Administrative Law
toupdateand amend existing regul ations.

The Department proposes to amend 84900 in Title
14, Division 3, Chapter 12 of the California Code of
Regulations (CCR), and repeal 84901, 84902, §4903
and 84904 concerning the Land and Water Conserva-
tion.

e The proposed regulation will amend 84900
Definitionsand incorporate by reference the Land
and Water Conservation Fund Program
Procedural Guide, Revised September 2007 to
implement, interpret, and make specific PRC
85099.10. Section 4900 Definitions lists eight
terms and their meanings. The Proposed
regulation will amend 84900 to incorporate and
update the Land and Water Conservation Fund
program description, application requirements,
project administration, administrative procedures,
and post selection federal requirements, including
authority, alocation of funds, eligibility criteria,
and expand the definitions section to 38 termsand
their meanings.

e The proposed regulation will repeal 84901
Authority because it is contained in the proposed
Amended 84900 incorporating by reference the
Land and Water Conservation Fund Program
Procedural Guide, Revised September 2007
whichsitesthe statutory authority for the proposed
regulation.

e The proposed regulation will repea 84902
Allocation of Funds becauseit is contained in the
proposed Amended 84900 incorporating by
reference the Land and Water Conservation Fund

334

Program Procedural Guide, Revised September
2007 which updates how funds are distributed for
the Land and Water Conservation Fund program.

The proposed regulation will repeal 84903 Project
Criteria because it is contained in the proposed
Amended 84900 incorporating by reference the
Land and Water Conservation Fund Program
Procedural Guide, Revised September 2007
which updates and expands the program criteria
and description including purpose of the program
and funding, summary of the competitive grant
process, timeline, eligibility criteriaof applicants,
eligible and ineligible projects, land tenure
requirements, match requirements, updates
application requirements including application
submission instructions, application requirements
checklist, resolution formand instructions, project
proposal criteria and instructions, cost estimate
form and instructions, e€ligible cost chart,
overview of CEQA/NEPA compliance, proposal
description and environmental screening form,
section (6)(f)(3) Boundary Map requirements,
State Historic Preservation Act MOU form and
contact information, certification of compliance
for development projects, lower tier covered
transactions, debarment and  suspension
instructions for certification, certification
regarding lobbying, civil rights assurance, post
selection federal requirements, and updates
project administration including sample grant
contract, contract provisions, grant payments,
grant progress status report, reimbursement
payments, payment request, sample performance
report, performance report, grant completion
packet requirements, project certification form,
grant expenditureform, forcelabor costssummary
form, equipment costs summary form and MOU
of unrecorded grant agreement, and updates
administrative procedures including changes to
grant scope, changes to project liquidation date,
signage, surcharge project costs, expenditure
guidelines, accounting requirements, record
retention, compliance inspections, conversions,
programincomeand audit requirement.

The proposed regulation will repeal 84904
Priorities Among Eligible Projects because it is
contained in the proposed Amended 84900
incorporating by reference the Land and Water
Conservation Fund Program Procedural Guide,
Revised September 2007 which details
information on how the LWCF funds are
distributed, provides a summary of the
competitive grant process including a LWCF
program processflowchart.




CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

FEDERAL REGULATION AND
STATUTE CONFORMITY

The LWCF is established on the federal level by the
Land and Water Conservation Fund Act of 1965 [16
U.S.C. 846014 through4601-11].

Thefederal statuterecommended:
Creation of anational recreation policy

That all agenciesadministering outdoor recreation
resources adopt programs designed to make the
best possible use of available resourcesin light of
people’ sneeds

That each State, through a central agency, should
developalong—rangeplanfor outdoor recreation

Establishment of an independent Bureau of
Outdoor Recreation

Establishment of a federal funding program to

providegrantsto States
The federal Land and Water Conservation Fund
Manual Release Number 151, December 9, 1991 serves
as a basic reference for States to administer the Land
and Water Conservation Grantsuniformly. Thismanual
provides broad outlinesthat are the basisfor the LWCF
program. The manual requires Statesto develop a State
Comprehensive Outdoor Recreation Plan; and the State
Comprehensive Outdoor Recreation Plan requires the
establishment of an open project selection process for
LWCEF grants, Title 36, Chapter 1, Part 59 U.S. Code of
Federal Regulations outlines State responsibility for
compliance and enforcement of these provisions for
Stateand locally sponsored projects. In order to achieve
the expected outcomes of the LWCF program and the
open project selection process, the Department has de-
veloped the Land and Water Conservation Fund Pro-
gram Procedural Guide, Revised September 2007.

The Department finds that it is authorized to adopt a
regulation that differs from federa statute. The pro-
posed amendment to the existing regulations supports
theprovisionsfoundin Statestatute.

INCORPORATION BY REFERENCE

The purpose of the proposed amendment to 84900 is
to incorporate by reference the Land and Water Con-
servation Fund Program Procedural Guide, Revised
September 2007.

DISCLOSURES REGARDING
THE PROPOSED ACTION

The Department hasmadethefollowing initial deter-
minations:

335

Mandateonlocal agenciesand school districts. None.

Cost or savingsto any stateagency: None.

Costtoany local agency or school district which must
be reimbursed in accordance with Government Code
§817500through 17630: None.

Other nondiscretionary cost or savings imposed on
local agencies: None.

Cost or savingsinfederal fundingtothe State: None.

Significant, statewide adverse economic impact di-
rectly affecting business including the ability of
Cdlifornia businesses to compete with businesses in
other states: None. Only Californiagovernmental orga-
ni zationswith management responsibilities over public
lands in the state of California are eligible to compete
for grantsunder thisprograrn.

Cost impacts on a representative private person or
businesses: The Department isnot aware of any costim-
pacts that a representative private person or business
would necessarily incur in reasonable compliance with
the proposed action.

Adoptionof thisregulationwill not:

(1) Createor eliminatejobswithin California;

(2) Create new businesses or eliminate existing busi-
nesseswithin California; or

(3) Effect the expansion of businesses currently do-
ing businesswithin California.

Significant effect on housing costs: None.

Businessreporting requirement: None.

Small business determination: The Department has
determined that the proposed regul ation does not affect
small business. Only California governmental orga-
nizationswith management responsibilitiesover public
lands in the state of California are eligible to compete
for grantsunder thisprogram.

CONSIDERATION OF ALTERNATIVES

In accordance with  Government  Code
811346.5(a)(13), the Department must determine that
no reasonabl eaternativeit considered or that hasother-
wise been identified and brought to the attention of the
Department would be more effectivein carrying out the
purposefor which the actionis proposed or would be as
effective and less burdensome to affected private per-
sonsthanthe proposed action.

The Department invitesinterested personsto present
statements or arguments with respect to aternatives to
the proposed regul ation during thewritten comment pe-
riod.

CONTACT PERSONS

Inquiries concerning the proposed administrative ac-
tionmay bedirectedto:



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

DebraGonzalez

Officeof Grantsand Local Services
Department of Parksand Recreation
1416 Ninth Street Room 918

P.O. Box 942896

Sacramento, CA 94296-0001
Email: dgonzalez@parks.ca.gov
Fax: (916) 6536511

Phone: (916) 6541618

Thebackup contact personfor theseinquiriesis:

BarbaraBaker

Officeof Grantsand L ocal Services
Department of Parksand Recreation
P.O. Box 942896

Sacramento, CA 94296-0001
Email: bbaker @parks.ca.gov

Fax: (916) 6516511

Phone: (916) 651-7743

Please direct requestsfor copies of the proposed text
(the“expressterms’) of theregulation, theinitial state-
ment of reasons, the modified text of the regulation, if
any, or other information upon which therulemakingis
basedto DebraGonzal ez at theaboveaddress.

AVAILABILITY OF STATEMENT OF REASONS
AND TEXT OF PROPOSED REGULATION

The Department will have the entire rule making file
available for inspection and copying throughout the
rulemaking processat itsofficeat theaboveaddress. As
of thedatethenoticeispublishedinthe Notice Register,
the rulemaking file consists of (1) this notice, (2) the
proposed text of the regulation, (3) the Land and Water
Conservation Fund Program Procedural Guide, Re-
vised September 2007, (4) theinitial statement of rea
sons, (5) C.C.R 88490084904, (6) “ A quick History of
theLand and Water Conservation Fund Program” histo-
ry from National Park Service, U.S. Department of the
Interior website, (7) Compliance Responsihilities and
Legal Protection (Title 36, Chapter 1, Part 59 U.S. Code
of Federal Regulations) from National Park Service,
U.S. Department of the Interior website, (8) Public Re-
sources Code 85098, 85098.3, 85099, 85099.2,
§5099.3, 85099.35, 85099.4, 85099.5, 8§5099.7,
85099.10, §5099.11, 85099.12, (9) Land and Water
Conservation Fund Technical Assistance Workshops,
(10) Land and Water Conservation Fund Draft Techni-
cal Assistance Workshops, (11) Land and Water Con-
servation Fund Act of 1965.

336

AVAILABILITY OF CHANGED
OR MODIFIED TEXT

After considering all timely and relevant comments
received, the Department may adopt the proposed regu-
lation substantially asdescribedinthisnotice. If theDe-
partment makes modifications which are sufficiently
related to the originally proposed text, it will make the
modifiedtext (withthechangesclearly indicated) avail-
abletothepublicfor at least 15 days before the Depart-
ment adopts the regulations as revised. Please send re-
guests for copies of any modified regulations to the
attention of Debra Gonzalez at the address indicated
above. The Department will accept written comments
onthemodified regulationsfor 15 daysafter the dateon
whichthey aremadeavailable.

AVAILABILITY OF THE FINAL
STATEMENT OF REASONS

Uponitscompletion, copiesof theFina Statement of
Reasons may be obtained by contacting Debra Gonza-
lez at theaboveaddress.

AVAILABILITY OF DOCUMENTS
ON THE INTERNET

Copies of the Notice of Proposed Action, the Initial
Statement of Reasons, and the text of the regulation in
underline and strikeout can be accessed through our
website at www.parks.ca.gov and by following thelink
toGrants.

TITLE 17. DEPARTMENT OF
DEVELOPMENTAL SERVICES

NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULEMAKING

RESPITE CARE RATE INCREASE 2008

The Cadlifornia Department of Developmental Ser-
vices (DDS) proposes to amend Title 17, Cdlifornia
Code of Regulations (CCR), Division 2, Chapter 3,
Subchapter 7, Article 5, Section 57310(b)(3), Method
of Reimbursement for Voucher Services, and
57332(c)(3)(A) & ()(9)(A), Maximum Rates of Reim-
bursement for Non—Residential Services.

WRITTEN COMMENT PERIOD

Any interested person, or hisor her authorized repre-
sentative, may submit written commentsrelevant to the
proposed regulatory action of DDS. The written com-



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

ment period closes at 5:00 p.m. on Monday, April 21,
2008. Please submit any written comments, via U.S.
Mail or fax or email, to the DDS contact persons desig-
nated below by 5:00 p.m.onMonday, April 21, 2008.

NO PUBLIC HEARING

No public hearing is scheduled for this rulemaking.
However, any interested person or hisor her duly autho-
rized representativemay request apublic hearing nolat-
er than 15 daysprior to the close of thewritten comment
period.

AUTHORITY AND REFERENCE

Authority: Section 4690, Welfare and Institutions
Code.

Reference: Sections 4648(a), and 4690, Welfare and
InstitutionsCode.

INFORMATIVE DIGEST/POLICY STATEMENT
OVERVIEW

Welfare and Institutions Code, Section 4690 man-
dates DDSto establish, maintain, and revise an equita-
ble processfor setting rates of payment for nonresiden-
tial services provided to the developmentally disabled.
Title 17 establishes the maximum reimbursement rate
for vouchered respite and in-home respite care work-
ers.

Effective January 1, 2008, California law increased
the minimum wage to $8.00 per hour. The regulation
changesareintended to reflect theincreasein the maxi-
mum rates of reimbursement appropriated for in the
Budget Act for Fiscal Year 2007-08 for respite services
provided under In—Home Respite Worker, Service
Codes 864, and 869, and Vouchered Respite Service,
ServiceCode420t0$10.71 per consumer, per hour.

Section 57310(b)(3) — Method of Reimbursement
for Voucher Services

The Department proposes to increase the maximum
reimbursement rate for in—home respite workers pro-
viding respite services under the voucher to $10.71 per
consumer per hour, effective January 1, 2008.

Section 57332(c)(3)(A) — Maximum Rates for Re-
imbursement for Non—Residential Services — In—
Home Respite Worker — Service Code 864.

The Department proposes to increase the maximum
reimbursement rate for in—home respite workers pro-
viding respiteservicesto $10.71 per consumer per hour,
including certain allocated costs, effective January 1,
2008.

337

Section57332(c)(9)(A)(2)(a) — Maximum Ratesfor
Reimbursement for Non—Residential Services — Re-
spiteFacility — Service Code 869.

The Department proposes to increase the maximum
reimbursement rate for respite facilities providing re-
spiteservicesto $10.71 per hour, including certain allo-
cated costs, effective January 1, 2008.

EFFECT ON SMALL BUSINESS

DDS has determined that the proposed regulations
will not affect small businesses as costsincurred dueto
this regulation change will be reimbursed by the De-
partment.

LOCAL MANDATE AND FISCAL
IMPACT DETERMINATIONS

DDS has determined that the proposed regul atory ac-
tion does not impose: 1) amandate on local agenciesor
school districts, 2) significant costs or savings to any
state agency, 3) coststo any local agency or school dis-
trict that must be reimbursed in accordance with Gov-
ernment Code sections 17500 through 17630, 4) other
nondiscretionary costs or savings imposed on local
agencies, or 5) costs or savingsin federal funding to the
State.

ECONOMIC IMPACT AND
BUSINESS ASSESSMENT

Based on DD S sfindingsitisanticipated that the pro-
posed action will have no economic effect on the cre-
ation of new jobs and new businesses within the state,
nor on the expansion of businesses currently doing
business within the State of California. DDS has also
determined this proposed action will not eliminate jobs
or existing businesses.

DDS has determined that the proposed regulations
will not have: 1) a significant statewide adverse eco-
nomic impact directly affecting business including the
ability of California businesses to compete with busi-
nessesin other states, or 2) asignificant effect on hous-
ing cost. DDSisnot aware of any cost impact that arep-
resentative private person or business would necessari-
ly incur in reasonable compliance with the proposed ac-
tion.

ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

DDS must determinethat no reasonable alternativeit
considered or that has otherwise been identified and
brought to its attention would be more effective in car-
rying out the purposefor which theactionisproposed or



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

would be as effective and |ess burdensome to affected
private personsthanthe proposed action.

DDSinvitesinterested personsto present statements
or arguments with respect to aternatives to the pro-
posed regul ations during the written comment period or
at thepublichearing.

CONTACT PERSON

General and substantiveinquires concerning the pro-
posed action may bedirectedto:

Department of Developmental Services
Community Rate Section

1600 Ninth Street, Room 310

Sacramento, CA 95814

Attention: David Temme

Phone: (916) 654—2982 Facsimile: (916) 654-1578
E-Mail Address. david.temme@dds.ca.gov

If the above person isunavailable, you may al so con-
tact Greg Saul, Branch Manager, Programs Operations
Branchat (916) 654-2982.

AVAILABILITY OF RULEMAKING
DOCUMENTS

DDS has prepared and has copiesready for public re-
view, an Initial Statement of Reasons for the proposed
regulations, al the information upon which the pro-
posed regulations are based, and the exact text of the
proposed regul ations.

Copies of the Notice, Initia Statement of Reasons
and text of the proposed regulationswill be made avail-
ablethrough DD S swebsiteat www.dds.ca.gov.

All other public records, reports, documentation or
other material related to the proposed regulations will
becontainedintherulemaking fileand will beavailable
for inspection and copying throughout the rulemaking
process from the contact persons at the above address.
Upon completion, the Final Statement of Reasons will
be made available by either contacting the persons
aboveor throughDDS' swebsite.

AVAILABILITY OF CHANGED
OR MODIFIED TEXT

After close of the comment period DDS may adopt
the proposed regulations as described in this notice. If
DDS makes modifications that are sufficiently related
to the originally proposed text, it will make the modi-
fied text, with changes clearly indicated, available for
public comment at least 15 days before DDS adoptsthe
regulations as revised. Requests for the modified text
should be madeto the contact person named above.

338

TITLE 24. BUILDING STANDARDS
COMMISSION

BUILDING STANDARDS
OF THE
DEPARTMENT OF FOOD AND
AGRICULTURE (AGR)

REGARDING AMENDMENT OF THE 2007
CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE (CPC), FOR
USE IN THE CALIFORNIA CODE OF
REGULATIONS (CCR), TITLE 24, PART 5

Notice is hereby given that the Department of Food
and Agriculture proposes to adopt changes to building
standards contained inthe CCR, Part 5, Title 24 for dai-
riesand placesof meat inspection.

PUBLIC COMMENT PERIOD

A public hearing has not been scheduled; however,
written commentswill beaccepted fromMar ch 7, 2008
until 5:00 p.m. on April 21, 2008. Please addressyour
commentsto:

CdliforniaDepartment of Food and Agriculture
1220N Street, A-114

Sacramento, CA 95814

Attention: Nancy Grillo, Regulation and L egislation
Coordinator

Animal Healthand Food Safety Services

Written Comments may aso be faxed to (916)
263-0959 or E-Mailed to CBSC@dgs.ca.gov.

Pursuant to Government Code Section 11346.5(a)17,
any interested person or hisor her duly authorized rep-
resentative may regquest, no later than 15 days prior to
the close of the written comment period, that a public
hearing beheld.

POST-HEARING MODIFICATIONS TO THE
TEXT OF THE REGULATIONS

Following the public comment period, AGR may
adopt the proposed building standards substantially as
proposed in this notice or with modifications that are
sufficiently related to the original proposed text and no-
ticeof proposed changes. If modificationsaremade, the
full text of the proposed modifications, clearly indi-
cated, will bemadeavailableto thepublicfor at least 15
days prior to the date on which the CBSC adopts,
amends, or repeal s the regulation(s). AGR will accept
written comments on the modified building standards
during the 15—day period.



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

NOTE: To be notified of any modifications, you
must submit written/oral commentsor request that
you benatified of any modifications.

AUTHORITY AND REFERENCE

The Department of Food and Agriculture proposesto
adopt these building standards under the authority
granted by Food and Agriculture Code Sections 18735,
18960, and 33481. The purpose of these building stan-
dardsisto implement, interpret, and make specific the
provisions of Food and Agriculture Code Sections
18735, 18960, 19834, 33481, and 33731.

INFORMATIVE DIGEST

Summary of Existing L aws

Food & Agriculture Code Section 18735. Adoption
of federal rules and regulations. The director may
adopt, by reference or otherwise, such provisionsof the
rules and regulations under the federal acts, with such
changes therein as he deems appropriate to make them
applicableto operations and transactions subject to this
chapter.

Food & Agriculture Code Section 18960. The direc-
tor may adopt, by regulation, standards and require-
ments relating to inspection, sanitation, facilities,
equipment, reinspection, preparation, processing, buy-
ing, selling, transporting, storing, identification, re-
cordkeeping, registration and labeling, and marking for
carrying out the purposesof thischapter.

Food & Agriculture Code Section 19384. Processing,
transportation and storage of carcasses, etc., for pet
food; diversioninto human food channels. The director
shall establish by regulation the condition under which
carcasses or parts or products of animals for pet food
may be processed, transported, and stored so asto pre-
vent diversioninto humanfood channels.

Food & Agriculture Code Section 33481. Regula-
tions, plansand specifications. Thedirector shall estab-
lish regulations and provide plans and specifications at
cost for the construction of sanitary milk barnsand milk
houseswhich are used in the production of market milk.
(Dairiesand placesof meat inspection)

Food & Agriculture Code Section 33731. Approval
of plansand specificationsfor new milk product plants.

Summary of Existing Regulations

Theexisting 2007 CaliforniaPlumbing Codeisapart
of the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, asore-
ferred to asthe CaliforniaBuilding Standards Code and
incorporates, by adoption, by the California Building
Standards Commission, the 2006 Uniform Plumbing

339

Code of the International Association of Plumbing and
Mechanical Officials. Currently, AGR does not adopt
model code standards for PEX water supply piping for
applicationsunder itsauthority.

Summary of Effect

The proposed action would amend Part 5 of Title 24
(2007 California Plumbing Code) by repealing amend-
ments contained in Sections 604.1 and 604.11 which
prescribe AGR’s non—adoption of model plumbing
code provisionsregulating the use of PEX water supply
piping. AGR proposes to adopt CPC Sections 604.1,
604.11, 604.11.1, and 604.11.2 regarding the use of
PEX inpotablewater supply systems.

Compar ableFeder al Statuteor Regulations

There are no comparable Federal Statutes or regula-
tionsrelated to the proposed action.
Poalicy Statement Overview

The broad objective of the proposed action isto re-
peal building regulations, in conformance with current
state law, and adopt model code standards for applica-
tionswithintheagency’sauthority.

OTHER MATTERS PRESCRIBED BY
STATUTE APPLICABLE TO THE AGENCY
OR TO ANY SPECIFIC REGULATION OR
CLASS OF REGULATIONS

The Department of Food and Agriculture has deter-
mined that there are no other matters prescribed by stat-
uteapplicabletotheagency or toany specificregulation
or classof regulations

MANDATE ON LOCAL AGENCIES
OR SCHOOL DISTRICTS

The Department of Food and Agriculture has deter-
mined that the proposed regulatory action would not
imposeamandateonlocal agenciesor school districts.

ESTIMATE OF COST OR SAVINGS

A. Costor Savingstoany stateagency: None

B. Costtoany local agency requiredto bereimbursed
under Part 7 (commencing with Section 17500) of
Division4: None

C. Cost to any school district required to be
reimbursed under Part 7 (commencing with
Section 17500) of Division4: None

D. Other nondiscretionary cost or savings imposed
onlocal agencies: None

E. Cost or savings in federa funding to the state:
None

Estimate: None



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

INITIAL DETERMINATION OF NO
SIGNIFICANT STATEWIDE ADVERSE
ECONOMIC IMPACT ON BUSINESSES

The Department of Food and Agriculture has made
an initial determination that the amendment of these
regulationswill not haveasignificant statewideadverse
economic impact on businesses, including the ability of
Californiabusinessesto compete with businessin other
states.

DECLARATION OF EVIDENCE

No facts, evidence, testimony or other evidence has
been relied upon to support theinitial determination of
no effect.

FINDING OF NECESSITY FOR THE PUBLIC'S
HEALTH, SAFETY, OR WELFARE

The Department of Food and Agriculture has made
an assessment of the proposed code changesand hasde-
termined that these changesdo not requireareport.

COST IMPACT ON REPRESENTATIVE PRIVATE
PERSON OR BUSINESS

The Department of Food and Agricultureisnot aware
of any cost impactsthat arepresentative private person
or businesswould necessarily incur in reasonable com-
pliancewiththe proposed action.

ASSESSMENT OF EFFECT OF REGULATIONS
UPON JOBS AND BUSINESS EXPANSION,
ELIMINATION OR CREATION

The Department of Agriculture has assessed whether
or not and to what extent thisproposal will affect thefol-
lowing:

[0 Thecreation or elimination of jobs within the
Stateof California.

Theseregulationswill not affect the creation of or
elimination of jobswithinthe Stateof California.

The creation of new busnesses or the
elimination of existing businesses within the
Stateof Califor nia.

These regulations will not affect the creation of or
the elimination of existing business within the
Stateof California

The expansion of businesses currently doing
businesswiththe Stateof California.

340

These regulations will not affect the expansion of
businesses currently doing business within the
Stateof California

INITIAL DETERMINATION OF SIGNIFICANT
EFFECT ON HOUSING COSTS

The Department of Food and Agriculture has made
an initial determination that this proposal would not
haveasignificant effect on housing costs.

CONSIDERATION OF ALTERNATIVES

The Department of Food and Agriculture must deter-
mine that no reasonable aternative considered by the
state agency or that has otherwise been identified and
brought to the attention of the agency would be more ef-
fectivein carrying out the purpose for which the action
is proposed or would be as effective and less burden-
some to affected private persons than the proposed ac-
tion.

AVAILABILITY OF RULEMAKING
DOCUMENTS

All of theinformation upon which the proposed regu-
lations are based is contained in the rulemaking file,
which isavailable for public review, by contacting the
person named bel ow.

Interested parties may obtain acopy of thefinal state-
ment of reasons onceit has been prepared, by making a
writtenrequest to the contact person named bel ow.

CBSC CONTACT PERSON FOR PROCEDURAL
AND ADMINISTRATIVE QUESTIONS

General questionsregarding procedural and adminis-
trativeissuesshould beaddressedto:

JaneTaylor, Senior Architect
2525NatomasPark Drive, Suite130
Sacramento, CA 95833

jane.taylor @dgs.ca.gov
TelephoneNo: (916) 263-0916
FacsimileNo: (916) 2630959

PROPOSING STATE AGENCY CONTACT
PERSON FOR SUBSTANTIVE AND/OR
TECHNICAL QUESTIONS ON THE PROPOSED
CHANGES TO BUILDING STANDARDS

Specific questions regarding the substantive and/or
technical aspects of the proposed changes to the build-
ing standardsshould be addressed to:



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

Nancy Grillo, Regulation and L egislation
Coordinator

Animal Health and Food Safety Services

CaliforniaDepartment of Food and Agriculture

(916) 6517280

ngrillo@cdfa.ca.gov

FAX (916) 653-4249

GENERAL PUBLIC INTEREST

TITLE 2. DEPARTMENT OF FAIR
EMPLOYMENT AND HOUSING

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that the prospective
contractors listed below have been required to submit a
Nondiscrimination Program (NDP) or aCaliforniaEm-
ployer | dentification Report (CEIR) to the Department
of Fair Employment and Housing, in accordance with
the provisions of Government Code Section 12990. No
such program or (CEIR) has been submitted and the
prospective contractorsareineligibleto enter into State
contracts. The prospective contractor’s signature on
Standard Form 17A, 17B, or 19, therefore, does not
congtitute a valid self—certification. Until further no-
tice, each of these prospective contractors in order to
submit a responsive bid must present evidence that its
Nondiscrimination Program has been certified by the
Department.

ASIX Communications, Inc.
DBA ASI Telesystems, Inc.
21150 CalifaStreet
Woodland Hills, CA 91367

Bay Recycling
80077thAvenue
Oakland, CA 94621

C& CDisposal Service
PO.Box 234
Rocklin, CA 95677

Choi Engineering Corp.
286 Greenhouse

Marketplace, Suite 329
SanLeandro, CA 94579

FriesLandscaping
25421 Clough
Escalon, CA 95320

MarindaMoving, Inc.
8010Betty LouDrive
Sacramento, CA 95828

MI-LOR Corporation

PO.Box 60

Leominster, MA 01453
PeoplesRidesharing

323 Fremont Street

San Francisco, CA 94105

San Diego Physicians& SurgeonsHospital
446 26th Street

SanDiego, CA

Southern CA Chemicals
8851 DiceRoad
SantaFe Springs, CA 90670

Tanemuraand AntleCo.
1400 Schilling Place
Salinas, CA 93912

TurtleBuilding Maintenance Co.
8132 DarienCircle
Sacramento, CA 95828

Univ Research Foundation
8422 L aJollaShoreDr.
LaJolla, CA 92037

Vandergoot Equipment Co.
PO.Box 925
Middletown, CA 95461

RULEMAKING PETITION
DECISIONS

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS AND
REHABILITATION

NOTICE OF DECISION ON PETITION TO
AMEND REGULATIONS

California Code of Regulations
Title 15, Crime Prevention and Corrections
Division 3, Adult Institutions, Programs and
Parole

PETITIONER
Tuvalu Tutuila, D-19029.

AUTHORITY

The authority granted by Government Code (GC)
Section 12838.5 vests to the California Department of
Corrections and Rehabilitation (CDCR) all the powers,
functions, duties, responsibilities, obligations, liabili-

341



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

ties, and jurisdiction of the abolished Youth and Adult
Correctional Agency, Cadlifornia Department of
Corrections, Department of the Youth Authority, Com-
mission on Correctional Peace Officer Standards and
Training, Board of Corrections, and the State Commis-
sion on Juvenile Justice, Crime and Delinquency Pre-
vention. Penal Code (PC) Section 5050 provides that
commencing July 1, 2005, any referenceto the Director
of Correctionsrefersto the Secretary of the CDCR. PC
Section 5054 vests with the Secretary of the CDCR the
supervision, management, and control of the state pris-
ons, and the responsibility for the care, custody, treat-
ment, training, discipline, and employment of persons
confined therein. PC Section 5055 provides that com-
mencing July 1, 2005, al powers/duties previously
granted to and imposed upon the CDC shall be exer-
cised by the Secretary of the CDCR. PC Section 5058
provides that the Director may prescribe and amend
regul ationsfor the administration of prisons.

CONTACT PERSON

Please direct any inquiries regarding this action to
Timothy M. Lockwood, Chief, Regulation and Policy
Management Branch, Department of Corrections and
Rehabilitation, PO. Box 942883, Sacramento, CA
94283-0001.

AVAILABILITY OF PETITION

The petition to amend regulations is avail able upon
request directed to the Department’ scontact person.

SUMMARY OF PETITION

Petitioner contendsthat the CDCR isimplementing a
statewide toilet flushing policy requiring each of its
institutions to install control flushing toilets in inmate
cellswithout complying with the Administrative Proce-
dure Act (APA), which constitutes the enforcement of
anunderground regulation.

DEPARTMENT DECISION

The Secretary of the CDCR declinesthepetitioninits
entirety.

The CDCR acknowledges that control flushing de-
vicesare beinginstalled oninmatetoiletsin many of its
institutions. However, the CDCR has not issued a state-
wide mandate requiring the installation of these de-
vices. Rather, the various CDCR institutions that are
installing these devices are doing so at the directive of
their respective Regiona Water Quality Control
Boards. Further, the Control Boardsin Californiahave
become much moreassertiveinrequiringareductionin
both water consumption and sewagedischargefor all of

342

their customers dueto federal and state mandates, gov-
ernor’s executive order, and legidlation that have al
beenimposed concurrently.

The Federal Clean Water Act placesrequirementson
water usage and cleanliness, and mandates that states
enforce those requirements. California’s enforcement
agency is the California Water Control Board, which
has jurisdiction over the state’'s Regiona Control
Boards. On July 27, 2004, Governor Schwarzenegger
issued Executive Order S—20-04, setting goalsfor ener-
gy conservationfor all energy userswithin specifictime
frames which include such things as waste water treat-
ment. Assembly Bill (AB) 900, known as the Public
Safety and Offender Rehabilitation Services Act of
2007, was signed by Governor Schwarzenegger on
May 3, 2007. The goal of AB 900 isimproved and ex-
panded rehabilitation and community reentry programs
designed specifically to reduce crime and enhance pub-
lic safety. This effort provides for the first and largest
prison capital outlay program in Californiain decades
by providing $7.7 billionin funding and bond resources
to add 53,000 in prison and jail beds. Many of the new
facilitieswill bel ocated adjacent to existing prisons.

Expanding existing or building new water treatment
facilities can take from 5 to 10 years, which is consid-
ered along term sol ution to increased sewage discharge
from increased water usage by CDCR institutions. Re-
gional Control Boards, however, havemovedto require
reduced water discharge by all of its larger customers
immediately. For example, the CaliforniaRegional Wa-
ter Control Board, Lahontan Region, found that both
the California Correctional Center at Susanville and
High Desert State Prison were consistently exceeding
their monthly average design sewage treatment capac-
ity. The Lahontan Water District advised the prisons
they were in violation on numerous occasions, and fi-
nally on July 13, 2005 issued a cease and desist order
that specifically ordered the prisons to impose con-
servation measures to include installation of low flow
showerheads, toilets and urinals, hot water solenoids,
and flush limiters with limits on the number of flushes
per hour. The Lahontan Water District doesnot haveju-
risdiction over any other CDCR institutions, except
thesetwo.

As another example, the California Regional Water
Quality Control Board, Central Valley Region, issued
cease and desist order no. R5—2006—0130 on December
8, 2006, mandating Mule Creek State Prison (MCSP)
cease and desist from discharging waste water in excess
of waste water design capacity. Hefty fines were im-
posed on MCSP, resulting in the prison implementing
immediate conservation measuresto include flush lim-
iters. Similarly, Ironwood State Prison, located in yet
another Regional Control Board jurisdiction, was not-
iced by that Regional Control Board that it was exceed-



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

ing its sewage design capacity and ordered to immedi-
ately implement conservation measures.

As stated previously, the CDCR acknowledges that
control flushing devices are being installed on inmate
toiletsin many of itsinstitutions. However, the CDCR
has not i ssued a statewiderulerequiring theinstallation
of these devices. The circumstances that are driving
various state prisons to impose more restrictive con-
servation measures apply to all water usersin aregion,
not just thelocal state prison. The CDCR maintainsthat
it is not within its authority to promulgate a statewide
regulation arising from amandate issued by aRegional
Control Board. L ocal mandates do not have astatewide
application, even though other Regiona Control
Boardsmay beissuing similar orderstotheir local water
users. The CDCR believesit doesnot haveclear author-
ity to adopt water and waste water regulations for its
institutions. Like other building and facility standards,
theseauthoritiesliewith other stateagencies.

ACCEPTANCE OFPETITION
TOREVIEWALLEGED
UNDERGROUND REGULATIONS

OFFICE OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW

ACCEPTANCE OF PETITION TO REVIEW
ALLEGED UNDERGROUND REGULATIONS

(Pursuant totitle 1, section 270, of the
California Code of Regulations)

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS AND
REHABILITATION

Agency being challenged:

The Office of Administrative Law has accepted the
following petition for consideration. Please send your
commentsto:

Rick Smith, Staff Counsel
Officeof AdministrativeLaw
300 Capitol Mall, Ste. 1250
Sacramento, CA 95814

A copy of your comment must al so be sent to the peti-
tioner and theagency contact person.

Petitioner:

Raul Aldrete, J-25863
D2-243L

CalipatriaState Prison

P.O. Box 5002

Calipatria, CA 92233-5002

Agency contact:

Timothy L ockwood, Chief of Regulations& Policy
Management Branch

Department of Correctionsand Rehabilitation

PO.BOX 942883

Sacramento, CA 94283-0001

The attachments are not being printed for practical
reasonsor space considerations. Howevey, if youwould
like to view the attachments please contact Margaret
Molinaat (916) 324—6044 or mmolina@oal .ca.gov.

PETITION TO THE OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATIVE LAW

RE: Alleged Underground Regulation
FROM: Raul Aldrete(Petitioner)

DATE: 12-12-07

Useof thisformisentirely optional. It requeststhein-
formationrequired by Title 1, CaliforniaCode of Regu-
lations, section 260, for a petition challenging an al-
leged underground regul ation. Although you are not re-
quired to usethisspecific form, the mandatory informa-
tion required by 1 CCR 260, including the supporting
documentation, must be included somehow in your
petition. If you create a separate petition, or if you use
thisform and need to add extra pages, be sure that each
pageislabeledclearly.

1. Identifying Information:

Your name: Raul Aldrete, Prisoner | D#J-25863

Youraddress: CalipatriaStatePrison, D2-243 L
P.O. Box 5002
Calipatria, CA 92233-5002

Your telephonenumber (if you haveone): N/A

Your email (if youhaveone): N/A

2. Stateagency or department being challenged:

CaliforniaDepartment of Correctionsand
Rehabilitation (CDCR)

3. Provide a complete description of the purported
underground regulation. Attach awritten copy of it. If
the purported underground regulation is found in an
agency manual, identify the specific provision of the
manual alleged to comprise the underground regula-
tion. Please be as precise as possible. As pertaining to
inmates, “[N]oin-evel transfersunlessthereisamedi-
cal/mental health necessity (of the inmate) or transfers
required to maintain the safety and security of theinsti-



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

tution.” (NOTE: The above quotation istaken directly
from petitioner’s own CDCR Director’'s Level Appeal
Decision, under I11. A, and the September 1, 2005 mem-
orandum addressed to all CDCR wardens signed by the
Deputy Director.
SEE ATTACHED CONTINUATION
PAGE—“LABELED CLEARLY”

4. Provide adescription of the agency actionsyou be-
lieve demonstrate that it has issued, used, enforced, or
attempted to enforcethe purported underground regul a-
tion. CDCR hasdenied, and continuesto deny petition-
er’'s/prisoner’s legitimate, legally—grounded request to
be housed in an “institution of the appropriate security
level and gender population nearest the prisoner’'s
home.” Penal Code(PC) 5068.

On 10/24/06 petitioner/prisoner appeared before the
Classification Committee at Calipatria State Prison
(CAL). Thiscommitteerefused to even submit petition-
er's/prisoner’s case to a classification staff representa-
tive.

SEE ATTACHED CONTINUATION
PAGE—“LABELED CLEARLY”

PETITION TO THE OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATIVE LAW
CONTINUATION PAGE TO:

PAGE 1, PART 3: DESCRIPTION OF PURPORTED
UNDERGROUND REGULATION

The five—page September 1, 2005 memorandum is
attached hereto. The specific language complained of
beginson linethree of pagethree: “Thisdirective (Bul-
letin 91/15) is hereby rescinded; with the exception that
there continuesto benoin-evel tranfersunlessthereis
a medical/mental health necessity (of the inmate) or
transfersrequired to maintain the safety and security of
theinstitution.”

Also attached isthe certification of CDCR stating
that AB 91-15 was rescinded. This certification is
not entirely true as the exception noted in the Sep-
tember 1, 2005 and the July 26, 2007 documentsis
currently beingenforced.

(DIRECTOR'S LEVEL APPEAL DECISION),
written by upper CDCR staff, states, “ Asdirectedinthe
September 1, 2005 Memorandum entitled Institution
Bed Management states, (sic) that there continuesto be
no inHevel transfers unless there is a medical/mental
health necessity (of the inmate) or transfersrequired to
maintain the safety and security of the institution.”
Dated July 26, 2007

Petitioner requests that the OAL reconsider its deci-
sion dated October 25, 2007 because the “exception”
wasclearly not rescinded and the certification that isthe
basis of the OAL decision is factually incorrect. The

344

October 25, 2007 OAL letter signed by Director Susan
Lapdley isattached hereto.

PAGE 1, PART 4; DESCRIPTION OF AGENCY
ACTIONS WHICH DEMONSTRATE IT HAS
ISSUED, USED, ENFORCED, OR ATTEMPTED
TO ENFORCE PURPORTED UNDERGROUND
REGULATION

<<<. . .(CSR)for transfer consideration purusant to
Title 15, California Code of Regulations (CCR), sec-
tions (88)3375(f)(3)(C)1-2; 3379(a)(1); i.e., improve
the inmate’s conditions of confinement by removing a
previously imposed restriction; approve an action re-
guested by the inmate; and submit the case to the CSR
for CSR’sapproval or denial.

On 11/29/06 petitioner/prisoner submitted an In-
mate/Parolee Appeal Form appealing theClassification
Committee'saction.

On4/17/07 petitioner/prisoner requested aDirector’s
Level Review of theappeal.

OnJUL 26 2007, the Director’sLevel Review (DLR)
denied Petitioner’sappeal, citing language found in the
September 1, 2005 memorandum addressed to all
California’s prison wardens and stated further that, “ the
[DLR] determined that the institution [Calipatria State
Prison; RA] was in compliance with California Penal
Code Section (PC) 5068 as the appellant’s transfer
would be unreasonable at this time based upon current
population pressures and the aforementioned memo-
randum.”

Petitioner’sName: Raul Aldrete
Date: Sept. 29,2007

5. Statethelegal basisfor believing that theguideline,
criterion, bulletin, provision in a manual, instruction,
order, standard of general application, or other rule or
procedure is a regulation as defined in Section
11342.600 of the Government Code AND that no ex-
press statutory exemption to the requirements of the
APA isapplicable. Petitioner, here, will be making di-
rect quotations from arecent OAL Determination, and
will supplant the particulars in the instant case in bra-
kets([]) so asto makethe distinction. Quoting from the
CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER
2007, VOLUME NO. 9-Z; OAL REGULATORY DE-
TERMINATIONS;, DEPARTMENT OF CORREC-
TIONS AND REHABILITATION; DETERMINA-
TION OF ALLEGED UNDERGROUND REGULA-
TIONS; 2007 OAL DETERMINATION NO.3 (OAL
FILE#CTU 06-0628-01); SEE PAGE 418: ANALY -
SIS

SEE ATTACHED CONTINUATION PAGE
—“LABELED CLEARLY”

6. Provide information demonstrating that the peti-

tion raises an issue of considerable public importance



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

requiring prompt resolution. PC 5068, whichiscitedin
petitioner’s/prisoner’s Inmate/Parolee Appeal Form,
statesin pertinent part: “the maintenance of [any strong
community and family ties] may aid in the person’sre-
habilitation.” In relation to PC 5068 Section 1 of
Stats.1989, ¢.1061, provides; “(a) TheL egislaturefinds
and declaresthat the maintenance of family tiesand the
development of familial relationshipsiscrucial to reha-
bilitation efforts. It istheintent of the Legislatureto fa-
cilitate the maintenance and development of family
relationships by incarcerating inmatesin the institution
closesttothe, . .>>>

SEE ATTACHED CONTINUATION PAGE

—“LABELED CLEARLY”

7. (Optional) Please attach any additional relevantin-
formation that will assist OAL in evaluating your peti-
tion.

SEEATTACHED

8. Certifications:

| certify that | have submitted a copy of this petition
andall attachmentsto:

Name:  K.W.Prunty, Under secretary,
Operations

Agency: CaliforniaDepartment of Correctionsand
Rehabilitation

Address; PO.Box 942883
Sacramento, CA 94283-0001

Telephonenumber: (916) 3221843

| certify that all of the above information is true and
correcttothebest of my knowledge.

/s
Raul Aldrete
Signatureof Petitioner

12-12-07
Date

PETITION TO THE OFFICE OF
ADMINISTRATIVE LAW
CONTINUATION PAGE TO:

PAGE 2; PART 5: PROCEDURE IS
REGULATION DEFINED IN 811342.600 AND
NO EXEMPTION TO THE REQUIREMENTS
OF APA ISAPPLICABLE

CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE
REGISTER 2007, VOLUME NO. 9-Z, p. 418:
“ANALY SIS

“A determination of whether the challenged rulesare
‘regulations’ subject to the Administrative Procedure
Act (APA) dependson (1) whether the challenged rules

345

contain ‘regulations within the meaning of section
11342.600, and (2) whether the challenged rules fall
within any recognized exemption from APA require-
ments.

“ A regul ationisdefinedin section 11342.600:

. .every rule, regulation, order, or standard
of general application or the amendment,
supplement, or revision of any rule
regulation, order, or standard adopted by any
state agency toimplement, interpret, or make
specific the law enforced or administered by
it,or togovernitsprocedure.

“In Tidewater Marine Western Inc. v. Victoria
Bradshaw, 14 Cal.4th 557, 571 (1996), the
CdiforniaSupreme Court found that

A regulation subject to the Administrative
Procedure Act (APA) (Gov. Code, § 11340 et
seq.). has two principal identifying
characteristics. First, the agency must intend
its rule to apply generally, rather than in a
specific case. The rule need not, however,
apply universally; arule applies generally so
long asit declareshow acertain classof cases
will be decided. Second, the rule must
implement, interpret, or make specific the
law enforced or administered by the agency,
or govern the agency’s procedure (Gov.
Code, 811342, subd. (g)).

“Thefirst element of aregulation iswhether therule
applies generaly. The [memo(s)] in question here ap-
pliestoall prisonersin Californiainstitutionsand there-
fore it applies to a clearly identified class of persons.
CDCR, [in the following documents and citations
thereof,] indicated that the [memo(s) were dissemi-
nated and intended for use] throughout Californiainsti-
tutiong[: the classification document, CDC 128-G,
dated 10/24/06— “nointer—evel transfers. . . .” Ulti-
mately this classification committee action was
upheld at the Director’slevel of review based on the
“exception” to therescinding of AB 91-15 noted in
the memorandum distributed system—-wide on Sep-
tember 1, 2005. Clearly, therescission of AB 91-15
did not encompassthat portion of AB 91-15 dealing
with “in—level transfers.” Thefact that the prohibi-
tion against in-evel transfersisstill being enforced
isevidenced by the Director’s Level Appeal Decision
dated JUL 26 2007—" As directed in the September 1,
2005 Memorandum entitled Institution Bed Manage-
ment states, (sic) that there continues to be no in-evel
transfers. . . .The institution has complied with
the. . .directive and has informed the appellant that
will (sic) not be referred. . .for transfer consider-
ation. . . .theDirector's Level of Review (DLR) de-
termined that the institution was in compliance with




CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

California Penal Code Section (PC) 5068. . .based
upon. . .theaforementioned memorandum”]. Thefirst
elementis, therefore, met.

“The second element isthat the rule must implement,
interpret or make specific the law enforced or adminis-
tered by the agency, or govern the agency’s procedure.
Penal Code section 5058 gives CDCR broad authority
to prescribe and amend rules and regul ationsfor the ad-
ministration of Californiainstitutions. It iswell within
CDCR'’s statutory mandate to determine [where and
why aninmate can be housed in any one of California’s
institutions. Penal Code section 5068 narrowsthe scope
of section 5058 to ‘ examination and study of prisoners;
classification; determination of prison; psychiatric or
psychological reports; (and) written evaluations.” PC
5068 specifically states. ‘Upon the basis of the ex-
amination and study, the Director of Corrections shall
classify prisoners; and when reasonable, the director
shall assign aprisoner to theinstitution of the appropri-
ate security level and gender population nearest the
prisoner’'s home, unless other classification factors
make such aplacement unreasonable.” And Penal Code
section 6400 narrows the scope of sections 5058 and
5068 even further to ‘amendments to Department of
Corrections regulations pertaining to visitation of in-
mates.” PC 6400 specificaly states: * Any amendments
to existing regulations and any future regulations
adopted by the Department of Corrections which may
impact the visitation of inmates shall do al of the fol-
lowing: (a) Recognize and consider thevalueof visiting
asameanstoimprovethesafety of prisonsfor both staff
and inmates. (b) Recognize and consider the important
roleof inmatevisitationin establishing and maintaining
ameaningful connection with family and community.
(c) Recognizeand consider theimportant role of inmate
visitation in preparing an inmate for successful release
and rehabilitation.’] This clearly implements or makes
specific Penal Code[s] section[s] 5058, [5068, 6400,
and] the law enforced or administered by CDCR. The
second elementinthe Tidewater caseismet.

“The final issue to examine in determining whether
CDCR has created an underground regulation by issu-
ing the [memo(s)] is determining if thereis an exemp-
tion from the APA. [In PC 5068, the annotation states:
‘Director of Corrections was required to follow notice
and hearing procedures of Administrative Procedure
Act (Gov. C. 811370 et seq.) prior toimplementing new
standardized classification system for purposes of de-
termining proper level of custody and place of confine-
ment of inmates as well as for planning and budgeting
considerations, since embodying asit did arule of gen-
eral application significantly affecting male prison pop-
ulation in custody of department, the comprehensive
classification system was not exempt asasarule of in-
ternal management nor did it fall within statutory ex-

346

emption (811342) relating to operational form. Stone-
ham v. Rushen (App. 1 Dist. 1982) 188 Cal.Rptr. 130,
137 Cal.App.3d 729. Prisons (key) 13(5).” The annota-
tion and case encompasses every aspect of the memo(s)
in question. Petitioner] therefore concludes that APA
rulemaking requirements generally apply to the
CDCR.

PAGE 2; PART 6: INFORMATION
DEMONSTRATING PETITION RAISES
ISSUE OF CONSIDERABLE PUBLIC
IMPORTANCE

<<<. . .inmate's home, whenever practica and
when requested by theinmate.” West's Ann. Cal. Penal
Code §5068

The family and friends of an incarcerated person are
severely impacted by virtue of the loss. The incarcer-
ated inmateisone, but thefamily and friends of theone,
left in the community, are many, and are the public it-
self. They need their incarcerated family member or
friend as close as possiblein order to facilitate the nec-
essary visits, for them.

Itisthepublicthat needsto haverehabilitated persons
being released from prison. Andthe CaliforniaLegisla
ture, as quoted above, has determined that these visits
are“crucial torehabilitation efforts.”

OAL REGULATORY
DETERMINATIONS

OFFICE OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW

DETERMINATION OF ALLEGED
UNDERGROUND REGULATIONS

(Pursuant to Government Code Section 11340.5

and Title 1, section 270, of the
California Code of Regulations)

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS AND
REHABILITATION

STATE OF CALIFORNIA
OFFICE OF ADMINISTRATIVE LAW

2008 OAL DETERMINATION NO. 1
(OAL FILE # CTU 07-0924-01)



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

REQUESTED
BY: ROBERT K.WALTERS
CONCERNING: DEPARTMENT OF

CORRECTIONSAND
REHABILITATION—
INDETERMINATE
SECURITY HOUSINGUNIT
STATUSFORDISRUPTIVE
INMATES.

DETERMINATIONISSUED
PURSUANT TO
GOVERNMENT CODE
SECTION 11340.5.

SCOPE OF REVIEW

A determination by the Office of AdministrativeLaw
(OAL) evauates whether or not an action or enactment
by a state agency complieswith Californiaadministra-
tive law governing how state agencies adopt regula-
tions. Nothing inthisanalysiseval uatesthe advisability
or the wisdom of the underlying action or enactment.
Our review is limited to the sole issue of whether the
challenged rulemeetsthedefinition of a“regulation” as
defined in Government Code section 11342.600 and is
subject tothe Administrative Procedure Act (APA). If a
rule meets the definition of a“regulation,” but was not
adopted pursuant to the APA and should have been, itis
an “underground regulation” as defined in California
Code of Regulations, title 1, section 250. OAL hasnei-
ther the legal authority nor the technical expertise to
evaluate the underlying policy issues involved in the
subject of thisdetermination.

ISSUE

On September 24, 2007, Mr. Walters submitted a
petitionto OAL challenging rulesissued inamemoran-
dum by the California Department of Corrections and
Rehabilitation (Department). The rules contained in
this memorandum are alleged underground regula
tions! issued in violation of Government Code section
11340.5.2 The aleged underground regulations are

1 An underground regulation isdefined intitle 1, California Code

of Regulations, section 250:
“Underground regulation” means any guideline, criterion,
bulletin, manual, instruction, order, standard of general ap-
plication, or other rule, including a rule governing a state
agency procedure, that is aregulation as defined in Section
11342.600 of the Government Code, but has not been
adopted as aregulation and filed with the Secretary of State
pursuant to the APA andisnot subject to an expressstatutory
exemption from adoption pursuant to the APA.

2Unless otherwise specified code references are to the California

Government Code.

contained in Memorandum DD81-02 (Memorandum),
issued by W.A. Duncan, Deputy Director, Institutions
Division, addressed to “Wardens, Classification and
Parole Representatives, Classification Staff Represen-
tatives and Correctiona Counselor |11's/Reception
Centers.” The subject of the Memorandum is*“ Indeter-
minate Security Housing Unit Statusfor Disruptive In-
mates.”

DETERMINATION

OAL determines that the Memorandum meets the
definition of a “regulation” as defined in section
11342.600 and that it should have been adopted pur-
suanttothe APA.

FACTUAL BACKGROUND

The Memorandum wasissued on August 26, 2002. It
is attached to this determination as Attachment #1. It
states, inpart:

Effective immediately, during the pre-Minimum
Eligible Release Date review, classification staff
shall consider Indeterminate SHU status for
inmates who have demonstrated the desire to be
disruptive and endanger the safety of othersor the
security of the institution. The following are
examples of inmates who may qualify for
consideration of Indeterminate SHU status:

1. Inmates currently serving a Determinate SHU
term whose in—custody behavior reflects a
propensity towards disruptive conduct, regardless
of whether theinmateisnot eligible for additional
Determinate SHU term assessment.

2. Specifically, inmates who have been assessed
three Determinate SHU terms for any offense or
assessed two Determinate SHU terms for
participation in ariot, melee, or disturbance. This
requirement shall be subject to all SHU terms
assessed on the same prison identification number
different to the inmate's term status;, e.g.,
“PVRTC”,“PVWNT", etc.

Mr. Walters states that disciplinary action has been
taken against him based upon enforcement of this
Memorandum. Due to the Memorandum, the Determi-
nate SHU sentence he had received wasalteredtoan In-
determinate SHU term.

UNDERGROUND REGULATIONS

Section 11340.5, subdivision (@), prohibits state
agencies from issuing rules unless the rules comply
withthe APA. It statesasfollows:

(a) No state agency shall issue, utilize, enforce, or
attempt to enforce any guideline, criterion,



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

bulletin, manual, instruction, order, standard of
general application, or other rule, which is a
regulation as defined in [Government Code]
Section 11342.600, unlessthe guideling, criterion,
bulletin, manual, instruction, order, standard of
general application, or other rule hasbeen adopted
asaregulation and filed with the Secretary of State
pursuantto[the APA].

When an agency issues, utilizes, enforces, or attempts
to enforce a rule in violation of section 11340.5 it
creates an underground regulation as defined in title 1,
CdliforniaCodeof Regulations, section 250.

OAL may issue adetermination as to whether or not
an agency issues, utilizes, enforces, or attempts to en-
forcearulethat meetsthe definition of a“regulation” as
defined in section 11342.600 and should have been
adopted pursuant to the APA. An OAL determination
that an agency has issued, utilized, enforced, or at-
tempted to enforce an underground regulationisnot en-
forceableagainst the agency through any formal admin-
istrative means, but it is entitled to “due deference” in
any subsequent litigation of theissue pursuant to Grier
v. Kizer (1990) 219 Cal .App.3d 422, 268 Cal .Rptr. 244.

To determine whether an agency issues, utilizes, en-
forces, or attempts to enforce an underground regula-
tion in violation of section 11340.5, it must be demon-
strated that the agency rule is aregulation not adopted
pursuant tothe APA and not exempt fromthe APA.

ANALYSIS

A determination of whether the challenged rule is a
“regulation” subject tothe APA dependson (1) whether
the challenged rule contains a “regulation” within the
meaning of section 11342.600, and (2) whether the
challenged rule falls within any recognized exemption
from APA requirements.

A regulationisdefinedin section 11342.600 as:

. . . every rule, regulation, order, or standard of
general  application or the amendment,
supplement, or revision of any rule, regulation,
order, or standard adopted by any state agency to
implement, interpret, or make specific the law
enforced or administered by it, or to govern its
procedure.

In Tidewater Marine Western, Inc. v. Victoria Brad-
shaw (1996) 14 Cal.4th 557, 571, the California Su-
preme Court found that:

A regulation subject to the Administrative
Procedure Act (APA) (Gov. Code, § 11340 et seq.)
hastwo principal identifying characteristics. First,
the agency must intend its rule to apply generally,
rather than in a specific case. The rule need not,
however, apply universaly; a rule applies

348

generaly solong asit declares how acertain class
of cases will be decided. Second, the rule must
implement, interpret, or make specific the law
enforced or administered by the agency, or govern
the agency’s procedure (Gov. Code, 8§ 11342,
subd. (9)).

The first element of aregulation is whether the rule
applies generally. The Memorandum requires that all
inmatesin the SHU with determinate sentencesthat are
considered disruptiveand adanger to othersor theinsti-
tution be considered for Indeterminate SHU status. The
Memorandum alsoliststhecriteriato beusedto classify
an inmate as requiring consideration of Indeterminate
SHU status. As Tidewater pointed out, a rule need not
apply to al personsinthe state of California. It is suffi-
cientif theruleappliesto aclearly defined class of per-
sons or situations. The Memorandum appliesto such a
clearly defined class of persons — inmates housed in
theSHU. Thefirst elementis, therefore, met.

The second element is that the rule must implement,
interpret or make specific the law enforced or adminis-
tered by the agency, or govern the agency’s procedure.
On July 1, 2005, the Department of Corrections, under
which this Memorandum was issued, was reorganized
into the Department of Correctionsand Rehabilitation.3
Penal Code section 5054 providesthat:

Commencing July 1, 2005, the supervision,
management and control of the state prisons, and
the responsihility for the care, custody, treatment,
training, discipline and employment of persons
confined therein are vested in the Secretary of the
Department of Correctionsand Rehabilitation.

Penal Codesection5058, subdivision(a), states:

The director may prescribe and amend rules and
regulations for the administration of the prisons
and for the administration of the parole of persons
sentenced under Section 1170 except those
persons who meet the criteria set forth in Section
2962. The rules and regulations shall be
promulgated and filed pursuant to Chapter 3.5
(commencing with Section 11340) of Part 1 of
Division 3 of Title 2 of the Government Code,
except as otherwise provided in this section and
Sections5058.1t0 5058.3, inclusive. All rulesand
regulations shall, to the extent practical, be stated

3 Penal Code section 5055:

Commencing July 1, 2005, al powers and duties previously
granted to and imposed upon the Department of Corrections shall
be exercised by the Secretary of the Department of Corrections
and Rehabilitation, except where those powers and duties are ex-
pressly vested by law in the Board of Parole Hearings.

Whenever a power is granted to the secretary or a duty isim-
posed upon the secretary, the power may be exercised or the duty
performed by a subordinate officer to the secretary or by aperson
authorized pursuant to law by the secretary.



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

inlanguagethat iseasily understood by thegeneral
public.

The Departmental policy requiring certaininmatesto
be considered for Indeterminate SHU statusand the cri-
teria for classifying these inmates expressed in the
Memorandum directly affects“the care, custody, treat-
ment, training, discipline and employment of persons’
in correctional institutions. The policy hasadirect im-
pact on inmates by resulting in an Indeterminate SHU
status. TheMemorandum, then, implements, interprets,
or makes specific Penal Code sections 5054 and 5058.
Furthermore, the Memorandum implements, interprets
and makes specific title 15 California Code of Regula-
tions, sections 3339 and 3341.5(c).# The second ele-
ment in Tidewater isthereforemet.

Thefinal issueto examinein determining whether the
Department has created an underground regulation by
issuing the Memorandum is determining if the Memo-
randum falls within an exemption from the APA. Ex-
emptionsfrom the APA can be general exemptionsthat
apply to all state rulemaking agencies.®> Exemptions
may also be specific to a particular rulemaking agency
or a specific program. Pursuant to section 11346, the
procedures established in the APA “shall not be super-
seded or modified by any subsequent legislation except
totheextent that thelegidation shall do soexpressly.”

Penal Code section 5058 establishes exemptions ex-
pressly for the Department:

(c) The following are deemed not to be
“regulations” as defined in Section 11342.600 of
theGovernment Code:

(1) Rulesissued by thedirector applying solely toa
particular prison or other correctional facility,
providedthat thefollowing conditionsare met:

(A) All rules that apply to prisons or other
correctional facilities throughout the state are
adopted by the director pursuant to Chapter 3.5
(commencing with Section 11340) of Part 1 of
Division 3of Title2 of the Government Code.

(B) All rules except those that are excluded from
disclosureto the public pursuant to subdivision (f)
of Section 6254 of the Government Code aremade
available to all inmates confined in the particular
prison or other correctional facility to which the
rules apply and to all members of the genera
public.

(2) Short-term criteria for the placement of
inmates in a new prison or other correctional
facility, or subunit thereof, during its first six

4 The subject matter of these sections is confinement and release
from the SHU.
5 See Government Code section 11340.9.

349

months of operation, or in a prison or other
correctional facility, or subunit thereof, planned
for closing during its last six months of operation,
provided that the criteriaare made available to the
public and that an estimate of fiscal impact is
completed pursuant to Sections 6650 to 6670,
inclusive, of the State AdministrativeManual.

(3) Rulesissued by the director that are excluded
from disclosure to the public pursuant to
subdivision (f) of Section 6254 of the Government
Code.

The first of these exemptionsin Pena Code section
5058(c)(1) is caled the “local rule” exemption. It ap-
pliesonly when aruleisestablished for asingle correc-
tional institution. In the case of this Memorandum, the
requirements apply to al institutionsin California. The
Memorandum, therefore, cannot be classified asa“lo-
ca rule”

The second exemption appliesto situationswhere an
institution is opening or is closing within six months.
Again, thatisnot applicablehere.

The final exemption is for rules that are excluded
from disclosure to the public. The Memorandum has
been widely distributed. Thereisno evidencethat it is
excludedfromdisclosuretothepublic.

We can find no other APA exemptionsthat would ap-
ply tothisMemorandum. The Department hasnot iden-
tified any express exemption from the APA that would
includethisMemaorandum.

AGENCY RESPONSE

The Department did not submit a response to this
petition.

CONCLUSION

The Memorandum meets the definition of a“regula-
tion” as defined in section 11342.600 and does not fall
within any express APA exemption, and therefore, it
should have been adopted pursuanttothe APA.

Date: February 20, 2008

19

Pegay J. Gibson
Staff Counsel

/s
SusanLapsley
Director

Officeof AdministrativeLaw
300 Capitol Mall, Suite1250
Sacramento, CA 95814

(916) 323-6225



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

Memorandum

Date August 26, 2002

To Wardens
Classificationand Parole Representatives
Classification Staff Representatives
Correctional  Counselor  Il1s/Reception
Centers

Subject: INDETERMINATE SECURITY

HOUSINGUNIT STATUSFOR
DISRUPTIVEINMATES

The purpose of this memorandum isto provide insti-
tution staff with direction relevant to the review and
program consideration of inmates who complete a De-
terminate Security Housing Unit (SHU) term and con-
tinueto poseathreat to the saf ety of othersor security of
the institution. This perceived threat may be based on
the inmate’s behavior while in SHU housing or due to
the inmate’s disciplinary history while housed in the
Cdlifornia Department of Corrections. Due to escalat-
ing violence occurring within the institutions, adminis-
trative staff are encouraged to review for appropriate
housing thoseinmateswho have ahistory of participat-
ing in disruptive behavior or fomenting violence and
unrest.

This direction is appropriate and within the parame-
ters of the California Code of Regulations, Title 15,
Section 3341.5(c), which states, “An inmate whose
conduct endangersthe safety of othersor the security of
theinstitution shall behousedinaSHU.”

Effectiveimmediately, during the pre-Minimum Eli-
gibleRelease Datereview, classification staff shall con-
sider Indeterminate SHU status for inmates who have
demonstrated the desire to be disruptive and endanger
the safety of othersor the security of theingtitution. The
following are examples of inmateswho may qualify for
consideration of Indeterminate SHU status:

1. Inmates currently serving a Determinate SHU
term whose in—custody behavior reflects a
propensity towards disruptive conduct, regardless
of whether theinmateisnot eligiblefor additional
Determinate SHU term assessment.

Specifically, inmates who have been assessed
three Determinate SHU terms for any offense or
assessed two Determinate SHU terms  for
participation in ariot, melee, or disturbance. This
requirement shall be subject to all SHU terms
assessed on the same prison identification number
indifferent to the inmate's term status, e.g.,
“PVRTC”,“PVWNT", etc.

This directive does not negate institution staff’s re-

sponsibility to properly identify and process inmates

suspected of prison gang membership or association.

350

If you have questions or require additional informa-
tion, please contact Marilyn Kalvelage, Chief, Institu-
tion Operations, Institutions Division, at or for techni-
cal information, contact Linda Rianda, Chief, Classifi-
cation ServicesUnit, at
1)

W.A. Duncan

Deputy Director

InstitutionsDivision

cc. EdwardS. Alameida, Jr.
David Tristan
Michael T. Pickett
E.Roe
AnaRamirez—Palmer
K.W. Prunty
Judy Buckman
Wendy Still
JanSale
MerrieM. Koshell
JimL’ Etoile
E.A. Mitchell
Roderick Q. Hickman
Gregory W. Harding
MarilynKalvelage
M. Shepherd
YvetteM. Page
Ernest C. Van Sant
Karl Kerkseick
LindaRianda
R. Manuel
GloriaRea
CarlosSanchez
Paul Bestolarides
Ombudsmen’sOffice(7)

SUMMARY OF REGULATORY
ACTIONS

REGULATIONS FILED WITH
SECRETARY OF STATE

This Summary of Regulatory Actions lists regula-
tions filed with the Secretary of State on the datesindi-
cated. Copies of the regulations may be obtained by
contacting the agency or from the Secretary of State,
Archives, 1020 O Street, Sacramento, CA 95814, (916)
653—7715. Please have the agency name and the date
filed (seebelow) when making arequest.

File# 2008-0122-01
BOARD OF EDUCATION
Educationa Interpreters

The federal Individuals with Disabilities Education
Improvement Act (IDEA 2004) requiresthat interpret-



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

ersfor pupilswho are deaf or hard of hearing meet state
approved or recognized certification, licensing, regis-
tration or other comparable requirements as defined in
the Code of Federal Regulations, section
300.156(b)(1). These amendments change the require-
ments for qualifications of personnel to provide educa-
tional interpreter servicesin public and private schools
and agencies. This is the resubmittal of the file
07-1015-04 SR which was disapproved on December
5, 2007.

Title5

CaliforniaCodeof Regulations
AMEND: 3051.16, 3065

Filed 02/22/2008
Effective03/22/2008

Agency Contact: ConnieDiaz (916) 3190860

Filet#2008-0110-01

CALIFORNIA INTEGRATED WASTE
MANAGEMENT BOARD

Closureand Postclosure M ai ntenance Cost Estimates

This regulatory action amends existing closure and
postclosure maintenance regulationsto clarify that cost
estimates are to reflect the State's costs should the re-
sponsible party fail to perform closure or postclosure
maintenance at a solid waste landfill. This regulatory
action also amends requirements for use of insurance
and the financial means test and includes cleanup lan-
guageinthefinancial assurancesregulations.

Title27

CdliforniaCodeof Regulations

ADOPT: 21815 AMEND: 21780, 21790, 21800,
21820, 21825, 21830, 21840, 21865, 22234, 22240,
22243, 22244, 22246, 22247, 22248, 22249,
22249.5, 22251, 22252, 22253, Division 2 — Ap-
pendix 3

Filed 02/25/2008

Effective02/25/2008

Agency Contact: RobertHolmes  (916) 3416376

File#2008-0131-01
CALIFORNIA STATEUNIVERSITY
Procedures— Additional Proposals

Cdlifornia State University isamending aregulation
regarding the Standardsfor Student Conduct.

Title5

CaliforniaCodeof Regulations
AMEND: 41301

Filed 02/25/2008
Effective02/25/2008

Agency Contact:

CassandraM. Andrews (562) 951-4500

351

File#2008-0204-02

DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONSAND
REHABILITATION

Earned Discharge From Parole

Thisregulatory actionisareadoption of an operation-
a necessity emergency to implement a new decision—
making process with accompanying assessment forms,
which are incorporated by reference. The purpose of
thisprocessisto effectively identify non—violent, non—
serious offenders who are at low risk for a re—offense
and who, following completion of 180 days of continu-
ous uninterrupted parole, may be eligible for an earned
dischargefrom parole.

Title15

CaliforniaCodeof Regulations
ADOPT: 3075.4AMEND: 3000
Filed 02/25/2008
Effective02/25/2008

Agency Contact: Randy Marshall  (916) 3417328

Filett 2008—-0219-02
DEPARTMENT OF FOOD AND AGRICULTURE
Light Brown AppleMoth Interior Quarantine

Thisemergency amendment will expand the existing
regulated area in Marin County to include an area of
Muir Beach as an additional quarantine area with re-
spect to the light brown apple moth (LBAM; Epiphyas
postvittana).

Title3

CaliforniaCodeof Regulations
AMEND: 3434(b)

Filed 02/22/2008
Effective02/22/2008

Agency Contact: StephenBrown  (916) 654-1017

File#2008-0123-02
DEPARTMENT OF INSURANCE
Salesto Military Personnel

Thisaction adoptsprovisionswhich protect members
of the armed forces from dishonest and predatory life
insurance sales practices. The provisions adopted are
patterned on the National Association of Insurance
Commissioners’ (NAIC) Military SalesPracticesMod-
el Regulation.

Title10

CaliforniaCodeof Regulations

ADOPT: 2695.20, 2695.21, 2695.22, 2695.23,
2695.24, 2695.25, 2695.26, 2695.27, 2695.28

Filed 02/22/2008

Effective02/22/2008

Agency Contact: GeorgeTeekell  (415) 538-4390



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

File#2008-0114-04
DEPARTMENT OF PESTICIDEREGULATION
Mill Assessment Criteria

Thisisafilesubmitted asachangewithout regulatory
effect for processing under section 100 proposed by the
Department of Pesticide Regulation seeking to amend
Title 3, section 6393(b)(8) to be consistent with the
changes made by Assembly Bill 126 (Ch. 279, Stat of
2007) which amended Business and Professions Code
section 8698.5 relating to funds collected through the
structural fumigation enforcement program. B& P sec-
tion 8698.5 was changed by AB 126 to provide that the
feescollected for thestructural fumigation enforcement
program shall be paid to the counties for that sole pur-
pose and shall not be used to “ supplant any other funds
provided to the county agricultural commissioner pur-
suant to Section 12844 of the Food and Agricultural
Code.” Food and Ag section 12844 authorizes the De-
partment to develop regulations allocating funds from
pesticide mill assessment. Currently, those mill assess-
ment regulations, in particular 6393(b)(8), require that
a county receiving structural fumigation enforcement
funds must subtract the structural fumigation fund
amount from any mill assessment allocation they are
seeking. Thus 6393(b)(8) currently requires that struc-
tural fumigation funds supplant the mill assessment
funds.

The proposed revision to 6393 isto makethe regula-
tion consistent with thestatutory change.

Title3

CdliforniaCodeof Regulations
AMEND: 6393

Filed 02/21/2008

Agency Contact:

Lindalrokawa-Otani (916) 445-3991

File#2008-0130-04
OFFICEOFADMINISTRATIVELAW
Proceduresfor Adopting Emergency Regulations

This rulemaking action implements, interprets and
makes more specific the amendments made to the Ad-
ministrative Procedure Act by Assembly Bill 1302
(Horton) regarding procedures for adopting and re-
viewing emergency regulations. The action informs
agencies (and provides model notice language) of their
fiveworking day noticeresponsibilitiesprior to submit-
ting proposed emergency regulations to the Office of
Administrative Law (OAL), except in cases of emer-
gency situations posing such immediate serious harm
that delay is not in the public interest. It itemizes the
content of an appropriate emergency submission to
OAL and specifiesthefactual standardsand statements
necessary for an agency to avoid the five working day
notice requirement. It emphasizes the requirement for

352

five working days notice prior to an agency submitting
emergency regulations for readoption and outlines the
contentsof an adequate agency request for approval of a
readoption. It clarifiesthat OAL shall not consider com-
ments sent directly to OAL in connection with Section
100 filings, but that OAL shall consider comments re-
ceived directly by it in connection with emergency reg-
ulations for five calendar days following posting on
OAL’s website, except in cases of emergencies for
which delay would not be in the public interest. It also
reminds the regulated public that it must simultaneous-
ly send emergency regulation comments to OAL and
theadopting agency.

Titlel

CdliforniaCodeof Regulations

ADORPT: 48,50,52 AMEND: 55

Filed 02/25/2008

Effective03/26/2008

Agency Contact: GeorgeC. Shaw  (916) 323-4217

File#2008-0108-02
OFFICEOFEMERGENCY SERVICES
T 19, Div. 2, Ch. 4, Article 4, Section 2729.2 and Ap-
pendicesA L, 11,111 & B, 11,111

Thischangewithout regulatory effect conformsthree
Office of Emergency Services hazardous materials re-
porting forms and instructionsin title 19 with counter—
part formsintitle 27, which were changed in December
of 2007 by the California Environmental Protection
Agency. The forms are used in administration of the
Unified Hazardous Waste and Hazardous Materias
Management Regulatory Program (hereafter “ Unified
Program”). Forms and instructions must be the samein
the Unified Program so that regulated entities use the
same forms and follow the same instructions no matter
which code they consult or which agency website they
use to download forms and instructions from. This ac-
tion also amends one title 19 regulation which makes
referencetothenow supersededforms.

Title19
CaliforniaCodeof Regulations
AMEND: Division 2, Chapter 4, Article 4, Section
2729.2 and AppendicesA 1, 11, 111 and AppendicesB
[ I
Filed 02/20/2008
Agency Contact: BrianA.Abeel  (916) 845-8510
File# 2008-0206-04
STATE PERSONNEL BOARD
DMV —Specia Examinationand A ppointment

The State Personnel Board is amending section
549.80, title 2, California Code of Regulations, entitled
“Department of Motor Vehicles. Managerial and Su-
pervisory Selection and Examination”. The amend-



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

ment is exempt from review by the Office of Adminis-
trative Law pursuant to Government Code Sections
18211 and 18213.

Title2
CaliforniaCodeof Regulations
AMEND: 549.80
Filed 02/25/2008
Effective01/22/2008
Agency Contact:
Dorothy Bacskai Egel (916) 653-1403

File#2008-0206-03

VICTIM COMPENSATION AND GOVERNMENT
CLAIMSBOARD

Reimbursement ratesfor mileagetravel expenses

The Victim Compensation and Government Claims
Board isamending section 714, title 2, CaliforniaCode
of Regulations, entitled “Transportation by Automo-
bile”. Theamendment isexempt from review by the Of -
fice of Administrative Law pursuant to Government
Code Section 11340.9(g), which exempt regulations
that establish or fix rates, pricesor tariffs.

Title2

CaliforniaCodeof Regulations

AMEND: 714

Filed 02/25/2008

Effective01/01/2008

Agency Contact: KevinD.Kwong (916) 491-3742

CCR CHANGES FILED
WITH THE SECRETARY OF STATE
WITHIN SEPTEMBER 26, 2007 TO

FEBRUARY 27, 2008

All regulatory actionsfiled by OAL during this peri-
od are listed below by California Code of Regulations
titles, then by datefiled with the Secretary of State, with
theManual of Policiesand Procedures changes adopted
by the Department of Social Serviceslistedlast. For fur-
ther information on a particular file, contact the person
listed in the Summary of Regulatory Actions section of
the Notice Register published on the first Friday more
thanninedaysafter thedatefiled.

Titlel
02/25/08 ADOPT: 48,50,52 AMEND: 55
01/29/08 AMEND: 1, 6, 90, and Appendix A (Std.
Form 400)

Title2
02/25/08 AMEND:549.80
02/25/08 AMEND: 714
01/07/08 AMEND: 1859.2, 1859.43, 1859.50,
1859.51, 1859.81, 1859.106
01/07/08 AMEND: 18531.61

353

01/03/08

12/26/07

12/19/07
12/18/07

12/17/07
12/17/07
12/13/07
12/13/07
12/13/07
12/06/07

ADOPT: 547.69, 547.70, 547.71
AMEND: 547.69 renumbered as 547.72,
547.70 renumbered as 547.74, 547.71
renumbered as547.73
AMEND: div. 8, ch. 54, sec. 54300

ADOPT: 18413

ADOPT: 1859.324.1, 1859.330
AMEND: 1859.302, 1859.318,
1859.320, 1859.321, 1859.322,
1859.323, 1859.323.1, 1859.323.2,
1859.324, 1859.326, 1859.328, 1859.329
AMEND: 58700

AMEND: 18351

ADOPT: 18531.2

AMEND: 18530.4

AMEND: 18421.2

AMEND: 649, 649.1 (Renumbered to

649.15), 649.1.1 (Renumbered to
649.16), 649.2 (Renumbered to 649.12),
649.3 (Renumbered to 649.24), 649.7
(Renumbered to 649.35), 649.8
(Renumbered to  649.36), 649.9
(Renumbered to 649.7), 649.10
(Renumbered to 649.22), 649.11
(Renumbered to 649.8), 649.12
(Renumbered to 649.9), 649.13
(Renumbered to 649.23), 649.14
(Renumbered to 649.27), 649.15
(Renumbered to 649.11), 649.16
(Renumbered to 649.30), 649.17
(Renumbered to 649.31), 649.18
(Renumbered to 649.26), 649.20, 649.21,
649.22 (Renumbered to 649.10), 649.71
(Renumbered to 649.25), 649.72
(Renumbered to  649.4), 650.1
(Renumbered to  649.6), 651.1
(Renumbered to  649.1), 651.2
(Renumbered to 649.14), 651.3
(Renumbered to 649.13), 6514
(Renumbered to 649.34), 6515
(Renumbered to  649.5), 652.1
(Renumbered to 649.39), 652.2
(Renumbered to 649.40), 653.1
(Renumbered to 649.42), 653.2
(Renumbered to  649.2), 653.3
(Renumbered to 649.41), 6534
(Renumbered to  649.37), 653.5
(Renumbered to 649.38), 653.6
(Renumbered to 649.61), 654.1
(Renumbered to  649.3), 654.2



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

10/31/07
10/30/07

10/17/07
10/15/07

10/09/07

10/03/07

10/01/07

Title3
02/22/08
02/21/08
02/11/08
02/08/08
02/04/08
01/29/08
01/28/08
01/28/08
01/25/08

01/24/08
01/22/08

01/22/08
01/22/08

(Renumbered to 649.43), 654.3
(Renumbered to  649.46), 654.4
(Renumbered to 649.44), 654.5
(Renumbered to  649.45), 654.6
(Renumbered to  649.47), 655.1
(Renumbered to  649.51), 656.1
(Renumbered to 649.52), 656.2
(Renumbered to 649.54), 656.3
(Renumbered to 649.55), 656.4
(Renumbered to 649.53), 656.5
(Renumbered to  649.56), 656.6
(Renumbered to  649.50), 656.7
(Renumbered to 649.58), 656.8
(Renumbered to  649.57), 657.1
(Renumbered to  649.59), 657.2
(Renumbered to 649.60), 657.3
(Renumberedto 649.62)

ADOPT: 18200

AMEND: 1138.10, 1138.30, 1138.72,
1138.90

ADOPT: 2970

ADOPT: 2291, 2292, 2293, 2294, 2295,
2296

AMEND: 1896.98, 1896.99.100,
1896.99.120

ADOPT:  1859.167.2, 1859.167.3

AMEND: 1859.2, 1859.163.3, 1859.167
REPEAL: 1859.167.1

ADOPT: 1859.71.6,1859.77.4 AMEND:
1859.2

AMEND: 3434(b)

AMEND: 6393

AMEND: 3434(b)

AMEND: 3591.20

AMEND: 3434(b)

AMEND: 3700(c)

AMEND: 3433(b)

AMEND: 4500

ADOPT: 6445, 64455, 6448, 6448.1,
6449, 6449.1, 6450, 6450.1, 6450.2,
6451, 6451.1, 6452, 6452.1, 6452.2,
6452.3(a),  6452.3(b),  6452.3(C),
6452.3(d), 6452.3(€), 6452.3(f), 6452.4,
6536(a), 6536(b)(1-3), 6536(b)(4)
AMEND: 6000, 6400, 6450, 6450.1,
6450.2, 6450.3, 6452, 6453, 6502, 6624,
6626, 6784

AMEND: 1391, 1391.1

AMEND: 3591.6

AMEND: 3591.6

AMEND: 3591.2(a)

01/22/08
01/18/08
01/18/08
01/11/08
01/10/08
01/07/08
12/26/07
12/26/07
12/21/07
12/20/07
12/19/07
12/19/07
12/10/07
12/06/07
12/03/07
11/29/07
11/29/07
11/27/07
11/27/07
11/21/07
11/16/07
11/15/07
11/14/07
11/14/07
11/09/07

11/06/07
11/01/07
10/29/07

10/29/07
10/25/07

10/15/07
10/03/07
09/28/07

Title4
01/22/08

01/10/08
12/26/07

11/21/07
11/09/07

10/25/07

10/24/07
Titleb5

02/25/08

02/22/08
12/20/07

11/19/07

354

AMEND: 3591.5(a)
AMEND: 3423(b)
ADOPT: 3152
AMEND: 3406(b)
AMEND: 3433(b)
AMEND: 1180.3.1
AMEND: 3433(b)
AMEND: 3963
AMEND: 3434(b)
ADOPT: 606
AMEND: 3700(c)
AMEND: 3433(b)
AMEND: 3406(b)

AMEND: 3589
AMEND: 3434(b)
AMEND: 3434(b)
AMEND: 3591.2
AMEND: 3406(b)
AMEND: 3433(b)
AMEND: 3433(b)
AMEND: 3417(b)
AMEND: 3434
AMEND: 3589
AMEND: 3591.20
AMEND: 3434(b)
AMEND: 3406(b)
AMEND: 1380.19, 1437.12
AMEND: 3433(b)

AMEND: 3406(b)
AMEND: 3591.20 (a& b)

AMEND: 3406(b)
AMEND: 3433(b)
AMEND: 3434(b)

AMEND: 8070, 8072,8073

AMEND: 1632
AMEND: 12002,

12203.2,12222

ADOPT: 12347
AMEND: 1371

ADOPT: 1747,1748
AMEND: 1486

12122, 12202,

AMEND: 41301
AMEND: 3051.16, 3065
ADOPT: 1202 AMEND: 1200, 1204,

1204.5, 1205, 1207, 1207.1, 1207.2,
1207.5, 1209, 1210, 1211, 1211.5, 1215,
1215.5,1216,1217,1218, 1219, 1225

ADOPT: 11981.3, 11984.5, 11984.6,
11985, 11985.5, 11985.6 AMEND:



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

11/05/07
10/29/07

10/24/07

10/02/07
10/01/07

Title8
12/31/07
12/28/07
12/11/07

12/10/07
12/04/07

11/29/07

11/26/07

11/05/07
10/31/07
10/30/07
10/23/07
10/10/07

10/10/07
10/09/07
10/03/07

Title9
02/13/08

11981 (renumber to 11980), 11982
(renumber to 11981), 11985 (renumber
11981.5), 11980 (renumber to 11982),
11986 (renumber to 11982.5), 11983,
11983.5, 11984

ADOPT: 18134

ADOPT: 24010, 24011, 24012, 24013
ADOPT: 11996, 11996.1, 11996.2,
11996.3, 11996.4, 11996.5, 11996.6,
11996.7, 11996.8, 11996.9, 11996.10,
11996.11

AMEND: 80001

AMEND: 43726

AMEND: 3650
AMEND: 1604.24
ADOPT: 9767.16, 9813.1, 9813.2

AMEND: 9767.1, 9810, 9811, 9812,
9813

ADOPT: 13800

AMEND: 3214, Figure E-1 of 3231,
PlateB-17

ADOPT: 33485 AMEND: 32135, 32166,
32500, 32630, 32700, 32781, 32784,
32786, 33480, 61020, 61450, 61470,
61480, 81020, 81450, 81470, 81480,
91020, 91450, 91470, 91480

ADOPT: 392.4 AMEND: 347, 350.1,
355,359, 359.1,371.2, 374, 385, 392.5

AMEND: 4324

AMEND: 1704

AMEND: 1532.2, 5203, 5206, 8359
ADOPT: 3324

ADOPT: 5349, 5350, 5351, 5352, 5353,
5354, 5355.1 AMEND: 5355, 5356,
5357,5358

AMEND: 4884

AMEND: 2320.2

ADOPT: 3458.1

ADOPT: 3100, 3200.010, 3200.020,

3200.030, 3200.040, 3200.050,
3200.060, 3200.070, 3200.080,
3200.090, 3200.100, 3200.110,
3200.120, 3200.130, 3200.140,
3200.150, 3200.160, 3200.170,
3200.180, 3200.190, 3200.210,
3200.220, 3200.225, 3200.230,
3200.240, 3200.250, 3200.260,
3200.270, 3200.280, 3200.300,

3200.310, 3300, 3310, 3315, 3320, 3350,
3360, 3400, 3410, 3500, 3505, 3510,

355

12/10/07
12/06/07

Title10
02/22/08

02/14/08
02/11/08
01/14/08
01/08/08

12/27/07
12/19/07

11/30/07
11/30/07

11/15/07
11/07/07
11/02/07
10/31/07
10/10/07
10/10/07
10/09/07

Title11
01/16/08

12/19/07
12/11/07

12/10/07

10/15/07

09/28/07
Title13

02/08/08
02/01/08

3520, 3530, 3530.10, 3530.20, 3530.30,
3530.40, 3540, 3610, 3615, 3620,
3620.05, 3620.10, 3630, 3640, 3650
REPEAL: 3100, 3200.000, 3200.010,

3200.020, 3200.030, 3200.040,
3200.050, 3200.060, 3200.070,
3200.080, 3200.090, 3200.100,
3200.110, 3200.120, 3200.130,
3200.140, 3200.150, 3200.160, 3310,

3400, 3405, 3410, 3415
AMEND: 13035

AMEND: 9100

ADOPT: 2695.20, 2695.21, 2695.22,
2695.23, 2695.24, 2695.25, 2695.26,
2695.27,2695.28

ADOPT: 2790.8,2790.9

AMEND: 5101

ADOPT: 2844 AMEND: 2840, 2842
ADOPT: 2240.5 AMEND: 2240, 2240.1,
2240.2,2240.3,2240.4

ADOPT: 1436, 1950.314.8

AMEND: 2698.82(b), 2698.84, 2698.87,
2698.89.1

AMEND: 2699.6611

ADOPT: 2699.6603, 2699.6604
AMEND: 2699.6603 (renumbered to
2699.6602), 2699.6605, 2699.6607,

2699.6608, 2699.6611, 2699.6625
AMEND: 2498.6

AMEND: 1409, 1422, 1423
AMEND: 2498.6

AMEND: 2318.6, 2353.1
AMEND: 2498.6

AMEND: 2218.63(b)

AMEND: 5.2001

REPEAL: 1305
ADOPT: 2021
AMEND: 300

AMEND: 1005, 1007, 1008
AMEND: 1053, 1054, 1055, 1058, 1070
AMEND:51.19

AMEND: 621, 691, 693, 699

ADOPT: 1300, 1400, 1401, 1402, 1403,
1404, 1405 REPEAL: 1300, 1301, 1302,
1303, 1304, 1304.1, 1305, 1310, 1311,
1312, 1313, 1314, 1315, 1320, 1321,
1322, 1323, 1324, 1325, 1330, 1331,
1332, 1333, 1334, 1335, 1336, 1337,
1338, 1339, 1339.1, 1339.2, 1339.3,
1339.4, 1339.5, 1339.6, 1340, 1341,



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

12/10/07
12/05/07

11/09/07

11/08/07

10/23/07
10/22/07
10/17/07
10/16/07

10/15/07
10/12/07

Title14
02/19/08
02/13/08
02/11/08

01/29/08

01/28/08

01/17/08
01/10/08
01/08/08
01/04/08
12/28/07
12/27/07

12/26/07

12/26/07
12/17/07

12/17/07
12/14/07

11/29/07

1342,
1353,
1362,
1371,
1401,

1343,
1354,
1363,
1372,
1402,
1410, 1411, 1412, 1413, 1414, 1415,
1416, 1417, 1418, 1420, 1421, 1422,
1423, 1424, 1425 andArticle 15 text.
AMEND: 553.70

ADOPT: 2166, 2166.1, 2167, 2168,
2169, 2170, 2171, 2172, 2172.1, 2172.2,
2172.3, 2172.4, 2172.5, 2172.6, 2172.7,
2172.8, 2172.9, 2173, 2174 AMEND:
1956.8, 1958, 1961, 1976, 1978, 2111,
2122, 2136, 2141, Incorporated Test
Procedures

AMEND: 1968.2, 1968.5, 2035, 2037,

2038
AMEND: 423.00

AMEND: 156.00
AMEND: 1090
AMEND: 811, 813
AMEND: 425.01

AMEND: 2023.1, 2023.3,2023.4
AMEND: 1201, 1212, 1212.5, 1213,
1234

1344,
1355,
1364,
1373,
1403,

1350,
1356,
1365,
1374,
1404,

1351,
1360,
1366,
1375,
1405,

1352,
1361,
1370,
1400,
1406,

AMEND: 7.50

ADOPT: 704

ADOPT: 787.0, 787.1, 787.2, 787.3,
787.4,787.5,787.6,787.7,787.8,787.9
ADOPT: 25202, 25203, 25204, 25205,
25206, 25207, 25208, 25209, 25210,
25211

ADOPT: 17987, 17987.1, 17987.2,
17987.3,17987.4,17987.5

AMEND: 890

AMEND: 1670

AMEND: 251.3

ADOPT: 11970 AMEND: 11900
AMEND: 1280

AMEND: 2.25, 2.30, 5.75, 5.86, 5.93,
5.95,6.37,7.50,8.00,670.5

ADOPT: 2990, 2995, 2997 AMEND:
2125,2518

AMEND: 2.00

AMEND: 17210.2, 17210.4, 17855.2,
17862,17867

AMEND: 632

ADOPT: 700.4, 700.5 AMEND: 1.74,
29.15, 116, 300, 551, 705

ADOPT: 916.9.1, 936.9.1, 916.9.2,
936.9.2, 916.11.1, 936.11.1, 923.9.1,

356

11/29/07
11/29/07

11/28/07
11/13/07

11/07/07
11/05/07
10/25/07

10/24/07

10/16/07

10/12/07
10/09/07

Title14,27
10/17/07

Title15
02/25/08
02/04/08

01/23/08
01/17/08

01/08/08
12/28/07

12/18/07
12/11/07

11/29/07
11/29/07
10/22/07
10/18/07
10/16/07

10/09/07
10/01/07

9439.1, 9239.2, 9439.2 AMEND:
859.1, 916.9, 936.9, 956.9, 923.9, 943.9,
963.9

AMEND: 895.1, 1052, 1052.1, 1052.4
ADOPT: 1093, 1093.1, 1093.2, 1093.3,
10934, 1093.6 AMEND: 895, 895.1,
1037

AMEND: 163, 164

AMEND: 1038(i)

AMEND: 550, 551, 552

AMEND: 825.05

AMEND: 502

AMEND: 895.1, 898, 914.8, 916, 916.2,
9169, 916.11, 916.12, 923.3, 923.9,
934.8, 936, 936.2, 936.9, 936.11, 936.12,
943.3, 943.9, 954.8, 956, 956.2, 956.9,
956.11,956.12, 963.3,963.9

ADOPT: 146, 2838, 2841, 28.42
AMEND: 1.17,1.59, 27.60, 27.90, 28.59,
159,195

AMEND: 815.05

AMEND: 29.85

Title 14: 18050, 18051, 18060, 18070,
18072, 18075, 18077, 18078, 18081,
18104.4, 18105.4, 18105.6, 18209,
18304, 18304.2, 18306, 18307, 18831
Title 27: 21563, 21615, 21620, 21650,
21680

ADOPT: 3075.4AMEND: 3000
ADOPT: 1700, 1706, 1712, 1714, 1730,
1731, 1740, 1747, 1747.5, 1748, 1749,
1750, 1751, 1752, 1753, 1754, 1756,
1757, 1760, 1766, 1767, 1768, 1770,
1772,1776,1778,1788, 1790, 1792
AMEND: 3190, 3191

AMEND: 2275

AMEND: 3282

ADOPT: 3269.1 AMEND: 3005, 3315,
3341.5

AMEND: 3052, 3054.1
AMEND: 176

AMEND: 2600.1
AMEND: 2616
REPEAL: 3999.1.8,
3999.1.10, 3999.1.11
ADOPT: 3486 AMEND: 3482, 3484,
3485

AMEND: 3000, 3045.2, 3170.1, 3176,
3177,3815

ADOPT: 2536.1

ADOPT: 3075.4AMEND: 3000

3999.1.9,



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

Titlel6
02/19/08
02/15/08
02/04/08
02/01/08

01/11/08
12/27/07
12/27/07

12/18/07

12/13/07

11/30/07

11/26/07

11/26/07

11/21/07
11/19/07
11/07/07
11/02/07

10/31/07
10/05/07

10/04/07
10/01/07

Titlel7
02/19/08
02/14/08

02/13/08
02/06/08

02/06/08

01/11/08
12/27/07

11/16/07
11/08/07

AMEND: 1887.2,1887.3

AMEND: 30, 95,95.2,95.6

AMEND: 2751

ADOPT: 1028.2, 1028.3, 1028.4, 1028.5
AMEND: 1021

ADOPT: 3340.43AMEND: 3340.42
AMEND: 1833.1, 1870

ADOPT: 1887.13, 1887.14 AMEND:
1816.7,1887.7

AMEND: 1707, 1709.1, 1715, 1717,
1746, 1780.1, 1781, 1787, 1790, 1793.8,
Form 17M-13, Form 17M-14 REPEAL:
1786

ADOPT: 1044.4 AMEND: 1044, 1044.1,
1044.3,1044.5

AMEND: 1805, 1806, 1816, 1816.1,
1816.2, 1816.4, 1816.6, 1854, 1856,
1858 REPEAL: 1833.3, 1855, 1857
ADOPT: 4400, 4402, 4404, 4406, 4420,
4422, 4424, 4426, 4428, 4443, 4500,
4520, 4522, 4540, 4542

ADOPT: 4580

AMEND: 998

AMEND: 1749

AMEND: 1523

ADOPT: 4440, 4442, 4444, 4446, 4448,
4450, 4452, 4470, 4472, 4474, 4476,
4478, 4480, 4482, 4484

AMEND: 1707.2

AMEND: 306, 306.1, 310, 390, 390.2,
390.3,390.4,390.5

AMEND: 1399.678

AMEND: 3394.6

AMEND: 70100.1, 70200

ADOPT: 30410, 30410.2 AMEND:
30421, 30424, 30445, 30447

AMEND: 2500, 2502

ADOPT: 2641.56, 2641.57 AMEND:
2641.5, 2641.30, 2641.35, 2641.45,
2641.55, 26435, 2643.10, 2643.15
REPEAL: 2641.75,2641.77

ADOPT: 2641.56, 2641.57 AMEND:
2641.5, 2641.30, 2641.35, 2641.45,
2641.55, 26435, 2643.10, 2643.15
REPEAL: 2641.75,2641.77

AMEND: 60201

ADOPT: 93109.1, 93109.2 AMEND:
93109

AMEND: 57310, 57332

AMEND: 94508, 94509, 94510, 94511,

94512, 94513, 94514, 94515, 94523

357

10/29/07

Title18
01/24/08
01/23/08
01/23/08

01/07/08

AMEND: 93119

AMEND: 1699

AMEND: 101,171

AMEND: 101,171

ADOPT: (new Division 2.1) 5000, 5200,
5201, 5202, 5210, 5210.5, 5211, 5212,
5212.5, 5213, 5214, 5215, 5215.4,
5215.6, 5216, 5217, 5218, 5219, 5220,
5220.4, 5220.6, 5221, 5222, 5222.4,
5222.6, 5223, 5224, 5225, 5226, 5227,
5228, 5229, 5230, 5231, 5231.5, 5232,
5232.4, 5232.6, 5232.8, 5233, 5234,
5234.5, 5235, 5236, 5237, 5238, 5239,
5240, 5241, 5242, 5243, 5244, 5245,
5246, 5247, 5248, 5249, 5249.4, 5249.6,
5250, 5260, 5261, 5262, 5263, 5264,
5265, 5266, 5267, 5268, 5270, 5271,
5310, 5311, 5312, 5321, 5322, 5322.5,
5323, 5323.2, 5323.4, 5323.6, 5323.8,
5324, 5324.2, 5324.4, 5324.6, 5324.8,
5325, 5325.4, 5325.6, 5326, 5326.2,
5326.4, 5326.6, 5327, 5327.4, 5327.6,
5328, 5328.5, 5331, 5332, 53324,
5332.6, 5333, 5333.4, 5333.6, 5334,
5334.4, 5334.6, 5335, 5335.4, 5334.6,
5336, 5336.5, 5337, 5337.4, 5337.6,
5338, 5338.4, 5338.6, 5340, 5341, 5342,
5343, 5344, 5345, 5410, 5411, 5412,
5420, 5421, 5422, 5423, 5424, 5430,
5431, 5432, 5435, 5440, 5441, 5442,
5443, 5444, 5450, 5451, 5452, 5454,
5460, 5461, 5462, 5463, 5464, 5465,
5510, 5511, 5512, 5521, 5521.5, 5522,
5522.2, 5522.4, 5222.6, 5522.8, 5523,
5523.1, 5523.2, 5523.3, 5523.4, 5523.5,
5523.6, 5523.7, 5523.8, 5530, 5540,
5541, 5550, 5551, 5560, 5561, 5562,
5563, 5570, 5571, 5572, 5573, 5574,
5575, 5576 AMEND: Renumber
Division 2.1 to 2.2, renumber Division
2.2 t0 2.3, renumber Division 2.3 to 2.4,
5090 (amend and renumber to 5600),
5091 (amend andrenumber to 5601),
5092 (amend and renumber to 5602),
5093 (amend andrenumber to 5603),
5094 (amend and renumber to 5604),
5095 (amend andrenumber to 5605),
5200 (amend and renumber to 5700)
REPEAL : 5010, 5011, 5012, 5020, 5021,
5022, 5023, 5024, 5030, 5031, 5032,
5033, 5034, 5035, 5036, 5040, 5041,
5042, 5043, 5050, 5051, 5052, 5053,
5054, 5055, 5056, 5060, 5061, 5062,



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

01/04/08
01/02/08
11/21/07
11/08/07

Title19
02/20/08

02/05/08
02/04/08
12/18/07
10/31/07
10/01/07

Title20
11/29/07
10/16/07

Title21
02/15/08
01/10/08

Title22
02/08/08

02/06/08
02/06/08
01/08/08
12/13/07

5063, 5064, 5070, 5071, 5072, 5073,
5074, 5074.5, 5075, 5075.1, 5076,
5076.1, 5077, 5078, 5079, 5080, 5081,
5081.2, 5082, 5082.1, 5082.2, 5083,
5085, 5086

AMEND: 1521

AMEND: 1802

AMEND: 4703

ADOPT: 474

AMEND: Division 2, Chapter 4, Article
4, Section 2729.2 and AppendicesA 1, 11,
I11 and AppendicesB I, 11, 111

REPEAL: 3.33

AMEND: 208, 209

AMEND: 2510, 2520, 2530, 2540, 2550
AMEND: 2040

AMEND: 2600

AMEND: 1601, 1602, 1605.3, 1606
ADOPT: 2900, 2901, 2902, 2903, 2904,
2905, 2906, 2907, 2908, 2909, 2910,
2911,2912,2913

AMEND: 1575
AMEND: 6662.5,
6754(b)(2)

6663(b), 6753,

ADOPT: 64551.10, 64551.20, 64551.30,
64551.35, 6455140,  64551.60,
64551.70, 64551.100, 64552, 64554,
64556, 64558, 64560, 64560.5, 64561,
64570, 64572, 64573, 64575, 64576,
64577, 64578, 64580, 64582, 64583,
64585, 64591, 64600, 64602, 64604
AMEND: 64590, 64593, 64654, 64658
REPEAL: 64417, 64555, 64560, 64562,
64563, 64564, 64566, 64568, 64570,
64600, 64602, 64604, 64612, 64622,
64624, 64626, 64628, 64630, 64632,
64634, 64636, 64638, 64640, 64642,
64644

AMEND: 2708(c) -1

AMEND: 2708(c) -1

ADOPT: 7107, 7118 AMEND: 7314
ADOPT: 64651.21, 64651.34, 64651.38,
64651.88, 646535, 64657, 64657.10,
64657.20, 64657.30, 64657.40, 64657.50
AMEND: 64650, 64651.10, 64651.50,
64651.53, 64651.60, 64652, 64652.5,
64653, 64654, 64655, 64658, 64660,
64661, 64662, 64663, 64664, 64666

358

12/06/07

11/29/07
11/20/07
11/08/07

11/07/07
11/06/07

10/23/07
10/18/07

10/16/07
10/03/07

ADOPT: 97930, 97930.1, 97930.2,
97930.3, 97930.4, 97930.5, 97930.6,
97930.7,97930.8,97930.9, 97930.10
AMEND: 51531

AMEND: 311-1

ADOPT: 72038, 72077.1, 72329.1
AMEND: 72077, 72329

ADOPT: 66269.1

AMEND: 51003(e) REPEAL: 51307,
51506.2

AMEND: 4400, 4409.1, 4415 REPEAL:
4440.1

AMEND: 67391.1

AMEND: 10100 REPEAL : 10101
AMEND: 67386.5,67386.6,67386.11

Title22, MPP

12/31/07

Title23
02/11/08
02/08/08
02/08/08
02/05/08
01/24/08
12/18/07

12/07/07
12/06/07
11/30/07
11/07/07

Title25
12/10/07

ADOPT: 86500, 86501, 86501.5, 86505,
86505.1, 86506, 86507, 86508, 86509,
86510, 86511, 86512, 86517, 86518,
86519, 86519.1, 86519.2, 86520, 86521,
86522, 86523, 86524, 86526, 86527,
86528, 86529, 86531, 86531.1, 86531.2,
86534, 86535, 86536, 86540, 86542,
86544, 86545, 86546, 86552, 86553,
86554, 86555, 86555.1, 86558, 86559,
86561, 86562, 86563, 86564, 86565,
86565.2, 86565.5, 86566, 86568.1,
86568.2, 86568.4, 86570, 86572,
86572.1, 86572.2, 86574, 86575, 86576,
86577, 86578, 86578.1, 86579, 86580,
86586, 86587, 86587.1, 86587.2, 86588
AMEND: 11-400c, 11402, 45-101(c),
45-202.5,45-203.4,45-301.1

ADOPT: 3939.27

ADOPT: 3939.28

ADOPT: 3939.30

ADOPT: 3939.29

ADOPT: 3939.31

AMEND: 2621, 2632, 2634, 2635, 2636,
2637,2638, 2661, 2666, 2711, 2713
ADOPT: 3919

ADOPT: 3918

ADOPT: 3959.1
ADOPT: 3915

ADOPT: 8207.1, 8212.3 AMEND: 8204,
8207, 8208, 8209, 8210, 8211, 8212,
8212.1,8213, 8216, 8217



CALIFORNIA REGULATORY NOTICE REGISTER 2008, VOLUME NO. 10-Z

Title27

02/25/08 ADOPT: 21815 AMEND: 21780, 21790,

21800,
21865,

21820, 21825, 21830, 21840,
22234, 22240, 22243, 22244,
22246, 22247, 22248, 22249, 22249.5,
22251, 22252, 22253, Division
2 — Appendix 3

12/18/07 AMEND: 15290 (reports 3, 4 & 6),

359

Title28
01/10/08

TitleMPP
11/28/07

15400.1, Division 3 — Subdivision 1 —
Chapters1,2,3,4,5,6

AMEND: 1300.67.60

AMEND: 47-110, 47-260, 47-301,
47430, 47-601, 47602, 47-620,
47-630REPEAL: 47610





